10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

11-74 Introduce: 6-6-11

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE amending Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code
(*LMC”), the Fire Code of the City of Lincoln, Nebraska, by amending Section 19.03.010 to adopt
the International Fire Code, 2009 Edition (“IFC”), as specifically amended by Chapter 19.03 of the
LMC; amending LMC Section 19.03.090 to increase the review and inspection fee for new
construction and alterations; amending LMC Section 19.03.100 to add and increase specified permit
fees; amending LMC Section 19.03.120 to increase the filing fee for appeals to the code official;
amending LMC Section 19.03.130 to relocate requirements relating to mobile home skirting within
the IFC; adding a new LMC section numbered 19.03.133 to delete Exception 4 from IFC Section
903.2.7 relating to Group M Sprinkler Requirements; amending LMC Section 19.03.135 to reflect
an IFC section number change; amending LMC Section 19.03.140 relating to monitoring sprinkler
systems; repealing LMC Section 19.03.143 which deleted Exception 2 from IFC Section 907.3.1.7
relating to fire alarm systems Group R-2 occupancies; adding a new LMC section numbered
19.03.144 to amended IFC Section 907.2.2 relating to Group R-2 occupancies; amending LMC
Section 19.03.160 to reflect an IFC section number change; repealing LMC Section 19.03.180
relating to permits for flammable and combustible liquids; repealing LMC Section 19.03.190
relating to prohibition on above-ground tanks; and repealing Sections 19.03.010, 19.03.090,
19.03.100, 19.03.120, 19.03.130, 19.03.135, 19.03.140, and 19.03.160 of the Lincoln Municipal
Code as hitherto existing.

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Lincoln, Nebraska:

Section 1. That Section 19.03.010 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

19.03.010 Code Adopted.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and
property from fire and explosion, there is hereby adopted the "International Fire Code," 2666 2009
Edition, save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified, or amended.

Section 2. That Section 19.03.090 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.090 Section 105.4.7 Added; New Construction and Alterations.

Section 105.4.7 is added to the International Fire Code to read as follows:

105.4.7 New construction and alterations. When plans and specifications required to be
submitted by Section 106.1 of the International Building Code is for construction of work for which
bureau of fire prevention approval is required, a separate and additional bureau of fire prevention
plan review and inspection fee shall be paid to the bureau of fire prevention. One-third of the fee
shall be paid at the time of submitting said plans and specifications for review and shall not be
refunded after any plan review has been completed by the bureau of fire prevention, even if the
application is withdrawn. The remainder of the fee shall be paid upon issuance of the building
permit. Said plan review and inspection fee shall be one dollar and tert twenty-five cents ($1.1625)
per $1,000 of total value of the proposed improvement; provided that the minimum fee for such plan
review shall be twenty-five thirty-five dollars ($25:66 35.00). Construction or work for which
bureau of fire prevention approval is required shall be subject to inspection by the code official and
such construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes until
approved by the code official.

Section 3. That Section 19.03.100 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.100 Section 105.6 Amended; Permits and Permit Fees.

Section 105.6 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

105.6 Permits and permit fees.
105.6.1 Permit required. A permit shall be obtained from the bureau of fire prevention
prior to engaging in the following activities, operations, practices, or functions and on items<{3);(4);

6893 and-12) (2). (4). (5). (7). (9). (10), (12), and (13), the premises shall be inspected

annually and a permit must be obtained each year to continue the activities, operations, practices,
or functions:

(1)  Carnivals, fairs, festivals.

b (2) Explosives and blasting agents, see Chapter 33.
2) (3) Fireworks, see Chapter 33 and LMC Chapter 9.44,
€3) (4) Flammable combustible liquids and tanks, see Chapters 22 and 34.
4) (5) Hazardous materials in excess of exempt amounts listed in Table 105.6.20.
€5) (6) Storage and use liquified petroleum gas, see Chapter 38.
6) (7) Places of assembly.
A (8) Pyrotechnic special effect material, see Chapter 33.
8) (9) Spraying or dipping operations utilizing flammable or combustible finishes, see
Chapter 15.
£9) (10) Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts that exceed 2,500 cubic feet, see Chapter
25.
6y (11) Temporary membrane structure, tent or canopy, see Chapter 24.

(11a) Temporary membrane structure, tents or canopies with assemblies with a capacity of

50 or more persons.

1) (12) Hotels and motels.
££2) (13) Fraternities and sororities.
13 (14) Installation of fire alarm systems.

(15) Child care facilities.




O© oo ~No o~

11
12

13

14
15
16
17

18
19

20
21

22
23
24
25
26

27
28
29
30
31

32
33
34
35
36
37

105.6.2 Permit fees. The following shall be the permit fees charged for the permits required

in this section:

(1)  Carnivals, fairs, festivals

b (2) Explosives and blasting agents

€2y (3) Fireworks display
Fireworks stand

£3) (4) Flammable combustible liquid tank installation

Tank closures

4 (5) Hazardous materials
Less than exempt amount
More than exempt amount

£5) (6) Storage and use of liquified petroleum gases

6) (7) Places of assembly
50 to 299 (annually)
300 to 999 (annually)
1000 or more (annually)

A (8) Pyrotechnics and special effects material
8) (9) Spraying or dipping
£9) (10) Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts

{16y (11) Temporary membrane structures, tents, canopies

(11a) Temporary membrane structures, tents,
canopies used as assembly
1 to 30 days erected
31 to 60 days erected
61 to 90 days erected

41y (12) Hotels and motels
0 to 40 rooms
41 to 120 rooms
121 to 200 rooms
201 or more rooms

&2 (13) Fraternities and Sororities
0 to 40 rooms
41 to 120 rooms
121 to 200 rooms
201 or more rooms

$100.00

$166-66 $125.00

$150.00

$106-66125.00/
$50.00 Late Fee
after 6/10

$56-66 75.00 per tank
$56-60 75.00 per tank

$-75:66 100.00
$125-66 150.00

$55-66 75.00

$56-66 75.00
$75-66 100.00
$166-66 125.00

$75-66 100.00
$65-66 75.00
$45-66 65.00

$56-66 100.00

$100.00
$150.00
200.00

$56-66 75.00
$75-66 100.00
$166-60 125.00
$125-66 150.00

$55-60 75.00

$ 75:66 100.00
$166-66 125.00
$125-66 150.00



23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32

13y (14) Fire alarm systems

1 to 30 devices $65:60 75.00

31 to 60 devices $95-66 105.00

61 to 90 devices $125:66 135.00

91 or more devices $155:66 165.00
(15) Child care facilities

1 to 8 children $50.00

9 to 12 children 60.00

13 or more children $70.00

Where work for which a fire-atarm permit is required by this code is started or proceeded
with prior to obtaining said permit, the fees herein specified shall be doubled; but the
payment of such double fees shall not relieve any person or persons from fully
complying with the requirements of this code in the execution of the work or any other
penalties prescribed herein.

4 (16) Reinspection fee/late fee (wrong address, equipment
that does not pass inspection, incomplete work,
equipment inaccessibility, etc. 1/2 Permit Fee
Minimum $25-66 35.00

5y (17) Late fee assessed if payment is not received

within 60 days of due date $50.00
16y (18) Fee for issuing a duplicate operational or
annual permit $20.00

105.6.3 Expiration. Every permit for-a-fire-atarm-system issued by the bureau of fire

prevention shall under these provisions expire by limitation and become null and void if the work
authorized by such permit is not commenced within 120 days from the date of such permit, or if the
work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work has
commenced for a period of 180 days. Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit shall
be first obtained and the fee thereof shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for such
work; provided that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. There shall be no
credits or refunds given on permits which have expired. Permit holders returning the unused permit
prior to the expiration date of the permit shall be limited to a maximum refund amounting to two-

thirds of the original fee if the original fee is $75.00 or less. For permits where the original fee was



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

greater than $75.00, a $25.00 processing fee will be levied and the remaining fee amount will be
refunded to the permit holder.

Sections 105.6.4 through 105.6.46 are deleted.

Section 4. That Section 19.03.120 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.120 Section 108 Amended; Board of Appeals.

Section 108 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Section 108. Board of Appeals. (a) Board of Appeals Created. In order to hear and decide
appeals of orders, decisions and determinations made by the code official relative to the application
and interpretation of this code, including but not limited to the suitability of alternate materials and
type of construction, there shall be and hereby is created a board of appeals, consisting of five
members who are qualified by experience and training to pass on pertinent matters. The code
official shall be an ex officio member and shall act as secretary of the board but shall have no vote
on any matter before the board. The board of appeals shall be appointed by the mayor and shall hold
office at the mayor's pleasure. The board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting
its investigation and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the code official with a
duplicate copy to the appellant and may recommend to the city council such new legislation as is
consistent therewith.

(b) Appeals to Board. Any person who is aggrieved by any order, decision or
determination of the code official relating to the application or interpretation of any provisions of
this code or to the suitability of alternate materials or methods of construction, may appeal such
decision by filing an appeal on forms furnished by the code official within thirty days from the date
of such decision. The filing of a completed appeals form, along with the payment of the prescribed
fee, shall be sufficient for the purpose of commencing an appeal proceeding hereunder.

(c) Filing Fees. The fee for each appeal filed with the code official shall be as follows:



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

1) Fwrenty-dotars $250.00 filing fee for review of a decision of the code official
involving an interpretation of any provisions of this code;

2 Fifty-dotars $250.00 filing fee for review of a decision of the code official
relating to the suitability of alternate materials or methods of construction.

(d) Hearing Date. The code official shall refer all properly and timely filed appeals to
the board of appeals for hearing. The secretary of said board shall in each appeal notify the appel-
lant in writing of the date, time, and place of hearing before the board, which date shall be no later
than thirty days from the filing of the appeal. Such notice shall be served upon the applicant by
personal service or registered mail.

(e) Hearing Procedure. Hearings on appeal need not be conducted according to technical
rules relating to evidence and witnesses. Oral evidence shall be taken only on oath or affirmation.
Any relevant evidence shall be admitted if it is the type of evidence upon which responsible persons
are accustomed to rely in the conduct of serious affairs, regardless of the existence of any common
law or statutory rule which may make improper the admission of such evidence over objection in
civil actions in courts of competent jurisdiction in this state. Irrelevant and unduly repetitious
evidence shall be excluded. The appellant, the code official, and any other party to an appeal
hereunder shall have these rights, among others:

1) To call and examine witnesses on any matter relevant to the issues of the
hearing;

2 To introduce documentary and physical evidence;

3 To cross-examine opposing witnesses on any matter relevant to the issues of
the hearing; and

4) To rebut the evidence against him or her.

()] Decision of Board. The board of appeals shall, within fifteen days after the hearing,
render a written decision which shall state its findings and conclusions. Decisions of the board may

be appealed as provided by law.



11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

(0) Enforcement. Enforcement of any decision, notice, or order of the code official
issued under this code shall be stayed during the pendency of an appeal therefrom which is properly
and timely filed, except in cases of emergency, where enforcement of the same is necessary for the
protection of life, limb, or property.

Section 5. That Section 19.03.130 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.130 Section 316 304.3.5 Added; Manufactured Home Skirting.
Section 316 304.3.5 is added to the International Fire Code to read as follows:

SECTHON316
MANUFACTUREB HOMESKIRHNG

316-1+—General: 304.3.5 Manufactured Home Skirting. Skirts shall be installed on all

manufactured homes. Skirting shall be of a rigid material which does not create a fire hazard. Rigid
foam insulation, chip board, Masonite, or any other wood products are not permitted skirting
material.

Section 6. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by adding
a new section numbered 19.03.133 to read as follows:

19.03.133 Section 903.2.7 Exception 4 Deleted; Group M Sprinkler Requirements.

Exception 4 to Section 903.2.7 of the International Fire Code is hereby deleted.

Section 7. That Section 19.03.135 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.135 Section 903.2.78 Exception Added; Group R Sprinkler Requirements.
An exception to Section 903.2.78 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:
Exception: A sprinkler system is not required when all of the following conditions exist:
1) The building is an R-2 occupancy and contains eight or fewer apartment units.
2 Separation is maintained between living units by means of one-hour fire partitions

creating a complete vertical separation from foundation to roof.

-8-



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32

3 Each living unit has its own separate exit access independent of other living units.
Section 8. That Section 19.03.140 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.140 Section 903.4.1 Amended; Stgrats Monitoring.

Section 903.4.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

903.4.1 Sigrats Monitoring. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly
different and shall be automatically transmitted to an approved central station, remote supervising
station or propriety supervising station as defined in NFPA 72 or, when approved by the code
official, shall sound an audible signal at a constantly attended location.

Exceptions:

1. Underground key or hub valves in roadway boxes provided by the municipality or
public utility are not required to be monitored.

2. Backflow prevention device test valves, located in limited area sprinkler system
supply piping, shall be located in the open position. In occupancies required to be equipped with
a fire alarm system, the backflow preventer valves shall be electrically supervised by a tamper
switch installed in accordance with NFPA 72 and separately annunciated.

3. Apartment buildings where the number of sprinklers are under 200 need not be
central station, remote station or proprietary monitored.

Section 9. That Section 19.03.143 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and the same

is hereby repealed.




gk wnN -

[ep}

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

Section 10. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by

adding a new section numbered 19.03.144 to read as follows:

19.03.144 Section 907.2.9 Amended; Group R-2.

Section 907.2.9 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

907.2.9 Group R-2. Fire alarm systems and smoke alarms shall be installed in Group R-2

occupancies as required in Sections 907.2.9.1 and 907.2.9.2. Fire alarms in dormitories, fraternities,

and sororities shall be monitored by an approved supervising station in accordance with NFPA 72.

907.2.9.1 Manual fire alarm system. A manual fire alarm system that activates the

occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group R-2

occupancies where:

1. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located three or more stories above the

lowest level of exit discharge;

2. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located more than one story below the
highest level of exit discharge of exits serving the dwelling unit or sleeping
unit; or

3. The building contains more than 16 dwelling units or sleeping units.

Exceptions:

1. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings not more than two

stories in height where all dwelling units or sleeping units and

contiqguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from each other and

public or common areas by at least one-hour fire partitions and each

-10-



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

dwelling unit or sleeping unit has an exit directly to a public way, exit

court or yard.

[N

Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is

equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in

accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 and the occupant

notification appliances will automatically activate throughout he

notification zones upon a sprinkler water flow.

|0

A fire alarm system is not required in buildings that do not have

interior corridors serving dwelling units and are protected by an

approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with

Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, provided that dwelling units either

have a means of eqress door opening directly to an exterior exit

access that leads directly to the exits or are served by open-ended

corridors designed in accordance with Section 1026.6, Exception 4.

Section 11. That Section 19.03.160 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.160 Section 3301.1 Amended; Fireworks.

Section 3301.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

3301.1 Fireworks. The provisions of this chapter and Chapter 9.44 of the Lincoln
Municipal Code shall govern the possession, manufacture, storage, handling, sale and use of
explosives, explosive material, fireworks, and small arms ammunition.

Exceptions:

1. The Armed Forces of the United States, Coast Guard or National Guard.

2. Explosives in forms prescribed by the official United States Pharmacopoeia.

3. The possession, storage and use of small arms ammunition when packaged in

accordance with DOTn packaging requirements.

-11-



10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

4. The possession, storage and use of not more than one pound (0.454 kg) of
commercially manufactured sporting black powder, 20 pounds (9 kg) of smokeless powder and
10,000 small arms primers for hand loading of small arms ammunition for personal consumption.

5. The use of explosive materials by federal, state and local regulatory, law
enforcement, and fire agencies acting in their official capacities.

6. Special industrial explosive devices which in the aggregate contain less than 50
pounds (23 kg) of explosive materials.

7. The possession, storage, and use of blank industrial-power load cartridges when
packaged in accordance with DOTn packaging regulations.

8. Transportation in accordance with DOTn 49 CFR Parts 100-178.

9. Items prepared by federal regulations.

Section 12. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.165 to read as follows:

19.03.165 Section 3301.1.3

Section 12. That Section 19.03.180 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and the same

is hereby repealed.




10

11

12
13

14

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27

28

Section 13. That Section 19.03.190 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and

the same is hereby repealed.

Section 14. That Sections 19.03.010, 19.03.090, 19.03.100, 19.03.120, 19.03.130,
19.03.135, 19.03.140, and 19.03.160 of the Lincoln Municipal Code as hitherto existing be and the
same are hereby repealed.

Section 15. Pursuant to Article VII, Section 7 of the City Charter, this ordinance
shall be posted on the official bulletin board of the City, located on the wall adjoining the City
Clerk’s office at 555 S. 10th Street, in lieu of and in place of newspaper publication with notice of

passage and such posting to be given by publication one time in the official newspaper by the City

13-



Clerk. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage and publication

as herein and in the City Charter provided.

Approved as to Form & Legality:

City Attorney

-14-

Introduced by:

Approved this ___ day of

, 2011:

Mayor




