07-207 A/R for Microfilming Supplies, County Records Management
Friday, July 6, 2007

First National Information
COMPANY NAME: AMS Imaging, Inc. Anacomp, Inc. ACS Image Solutions Solutions Spectramedia, Inc.
REPRESENTATIVE: James Fiore Hans Hedfeld Darlene Cross Brent Warwick Barbara Garrett
ADDRESS: 2670 Warwick Avenue 15378 Avenue of Science 2847 Virlilia Road 4528 F Street PO Box 57674
CITY,STATE,ZIP: Warwick, Rl 02889 SanDiego, CA 92128 Flora MS 39071 Omaha, NE 68117 Tucson, Arizona 85732
PHONE: 401-738-5111 800-920-7378 800-647-7140 X 1143 402-633-2134 1-866-545-8490
FAX{ 800-984-6443 601-879-1286 402-633-2121 1-866-785-2853
EMAIL: jimPFiore@aol.com supplyorders@anacomp.com darlene.cross@acs.inc.com Bwarwick@FNISolutions.com spectramediainc@aol.com
[item Description Qty U/M Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Kodak Datalink Silver Halide Open
1 [Reel Microfilm 600 rolls $6.60[ $3,960.00 $6.70[ $4,020.00 $7.05[ $4,230.00{Not Available $0.00 $4.20( $2,520.00
Manufacturer/No. None Listed Kodak - EO21510 Kodak - 1700822 Kodak - 170-0822 FUJI - SB 100
2 _|16mm Diazo Duplicate film, 1000’ rl., 100 rolls $11.38] $1,138.00 $8.92[  $892.00 $9.57| $957.00 $0.00 $9.50[  $950.00
20 rolls per case 5 Cases| $206.40] $1,032.00
Manufacturer/No. FUJI - EM 11200 Intelicoat - 562081R Kodak - 1233066 Kodak - 123-3006 Intelicoat - EM 11200
3 |35mm Silver Original film Kodak Catd 20 rolls $15.75 $315.00 $13.95[  $279.00 $14.84] $296.80 $0.00 $9.00] $180.00
1 Case $305.00 $305.00
Manufacturer/No. KODAK 840-3594 Kodak - E021518 Kodak - 8403594 Kodak - 840-3594 FUJI - HR -20
4 |35mm Diazo Duplicate film 1000 x 4 40 rolls $24.49 $979.60 $19.28]  $771.20 $23.54 $941.60 $0.00 $22.00[ $880.00
4 Cases| $254.00[ $1,016.00
Manufacturer/No. FUJI - EM 11400 Intelicoat - 562281R Kodak - 1308931 Kodak - 130-8931 Interlicoat - EM 11400
5 |Developer, Kodak Catalog #102-249| 10 cases 75.69| $756.90 72.40] $724.00 76.19| $761.90 $83.20 $832.00 $35.00[  $350.00
Manufacturer/No. Kodak - 102-2490 Kodak - E022301 Kodak - 1022490 Kodak - 102-2490 FUJI - 140
6 |Fixer, Kodak #102-2656 or equiv., 4 7 cases $47.66 $333.62 $45.60 $319.20 48.00 $336.00 $52.40 $366.80 $20.00[ $140.00
Manufacturer/No. Kodak - 102-2656 Kodak - E022302 Kodak - 1022656 Kodak - 102-2656 FUJI - 141
7 |Ammonium Hydroxide 24 degree Ba 4 gal $16.86 $67.45|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00
1 case $103.08] $103.08 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
W.D. Service - 24-
Manufacturer/No. DEG MichlinDiazo - M090003
8 |Michlin MO90011 absorber 4 gal $28.75[  $115.00[No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00|No Bid $0.00
1 case $99.54 $99.54 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MichlinDiazo -
Manufacturer/No. W.D. Service - #44B M090032/abs crystals
9 |Kodak Fixer-wash system cleaner, g4 2 case $76.80 $153.60 $67.00 $134.00 $68.24 $136.48 $754.00] $1,508.00[(No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer/No. Kodak - 150-0719 Kodak - EO22321 Kodak - 1395110 Kodak - 139-5110
10 [Solutek Cleaner/Replenisher 4 gal/cal 2 cases [No Bid $0.00 $66.50 $133.00|No Bid $0.00{No Bid $0.00{No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer/No. Solutek - S042327
11 [35mm Leaders, Kodak catalog #199- 8 boxes $8.82| $70.56 $6.20| $49.60 $6.65| $53.20 $7.35] $58.80|No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer/No. Kodak - 199-1009 Kodak - EO 22179 Kodak - 1991009 Kodak - 199-1009
12 [16mm self locking duplicate reels, wf 500 [ea $0.33 $162.50 $0.1850 $92.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.25[  $125.00
1 case $118.75 $118.75 $120.00 $120.00
Manufacturer/No. Zeta - PSFWSR Zeta - Z043908 Microfilm Product M565 Zeta Products - PSFWR Zeta - PFSWSR
16mm Silver Original film Kodak
13 |100'/roll 140 rolls $9.33[  $1,306.20 $8.70[ $1,218.00 $8.79| $1,230.60 $170.80[ $1,195.60|No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer/No. Kodak - 833-0896 Kodak - EO21505 Kodak - 8330896 Kodak - 833-0896
14 |16mm microfilm craft board storage if 1000 |ea $0.20) $200.00 $0.10776]  $107.76 $0.00 $0.15[  $150.00
1 $118.75 $118.75 $92.50 $370.00
MicrofileProducts - Microfilm Products -
Manufacturer/No. Zeta - SB16P M202120 MS535 Zeta Products - SB16AF Zeta - SB16P
15 [35mm microfilm white craft board sto] 1000 _|ea $0.28]  $280.00 $0.1650]  $165.00 $0.00 $0.22] $220.00]
1 $188.25 $188.25 $115.00 $460.00
Microfilm Products - MS
Manufacturer/No. Zeta - SB35P Zeta - 2043976 536 Zeta Products - SB35AF Zeta SB35P
16 [35mm duplicate reels 500 [ea $0.40) $200.00 $0.4182|  $209.10 $0.00|No Bid $0.00 $0.40[  $200.00
250 per case 2 cases $81.25 $162.50
MicrofilmProducts -
Manufacturer/No. Zeta - OFR35SS M202150 MS 519 Zeta - SFR3555
17 |Kodak reference archive media 180 rolls $17.50[ $3,150.00 $16.40[ $2,952.00 $16.88[ $3,038.40 $351.00] $3,159.00(No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer/No. Kodak - 862-5147 Kodak - EO21746 Kodak - 8625147 Kodak - 862-5147
Grand Total 13,208.60 12,248.81 12,570.23 10,423.20 5,715.00




