
15-129 Introduce: 9-28-15 

ORDINANCE NO. _________________

AN ORDINANCE amending Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code1

(“LMC”), the Fire Code, by amending LMC Section 19.03.010 to adopt the 2012 edition of2

International Fire Code (“IFC”), as specifically amended by Chapter 19.03 of the LMC; amending3

LMC Section 19.03.100 (IFC 105.6) relating to required permits and permit fees; adding a new4

LMC section numbered 19.03.125 to amend IFC Section 202 to add the definition of sky lanterns;5

adding a new LMC section numbered 19.03.131 to add IFC Section 307.6 to authorize the fire code6

official or the fire department to order fire extinguishment under certain conditions; adding a new7

LMC section numbered Section 19.03.132 to add IFC Section 308.1.2.1 to prohibit the sale, lighting8

of, or release of sky lanterns; repealing LMC Section 19.03.135 to remove the Group R sprinkler9

system exception, repealing LMC Sections 19.03.144, 19.03.150, 19.03.170 to delete previous10

amendments to IFC Sections 907.2.9, 1504.9, and 3308.3, respectively; and repealing Sections11

19.03.010, 19.03.090 and 19.03.100 of the Lincoln Municipal Code as hitherto existing.12

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Lincoln, Nebraska:13

Section 1.  That Section 19.03.010 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to14

read as follows:15

19.03.010 Code Adopted.  16

For the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and17

property from fire and explosion, there is hereby adopted the “International Fire Code,” 2009 201218

Edition, save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified, or amended.  19

Section 2.  That Section 19.03.100 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to20

read as follows:21



19.03.100 Section 105.6 Amended; Permits and Permit Fees.1

Section 105.6 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:2

105.6  Permits and permit fees.3

105.6.1  Permit required.  A permit shall be obtained from the bureau of fire prevention4

prior to engaging in the following activities, operations, practices, or functions and on items (2), (4),5

(5), (7), (9), (10), (12), (13), (16), (17), (18), (19), and (21) the premises shall be inspected annually6

and a permit must be obtained each year to continue the activities, operations, practices, or7

functions:8

(1) Carnivals, fairs, festivals.9

(2) Explosives and blasting agents, see Chapter 33.10

(3) Fireworks, see Chapter 33 and L.M.C. Chapter 9.44.11

(4) Flammable combustible liquids and tanks, see Chapters 22 and 34.12

(5) Hazardous materials in excess of exempt amounts listed in Table 105.6.20.13

(6) Storage and use liquified liquefied petroleum gas, see Chapter 38.14

(7) Places of assembly.15

(8) Pyrotechnic special effect material, see Chapter 33.16

(9) Spraying or dipping operations utilizing flammable or combustible finishes, see17
Chapter 15.18

(10) Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts that exceed 2,500 cubic feet, see Chapter 19
25.20

(11) Temporary membrane structure, tent or canopy, see Chapter 24.21

(11a) Temporary membrane structure, tents or canopies with assemblies with a capacity22
of 50 or more persons.23

(12) Hotels and motels.24

(13) Fraternities and sororities.25

(14) Installation of fire alarm systems.26

(15) Child care facilities.27

(16) Schools as defined in Section 27.02.200.28

(17) Hospitals as defined in Section 27.02.090.29

(18) Nursing Care Facilities as defined in Section 27.02.15030

(19) Health Care Facilities (residential and non-residential) as defined in Section31
27.02.090.32

-2-



(20) Liquor Establishments.1

(21) Mobile Home Court as defined in Section 21.56.010.2

105.6.2  Permit fees.  The following shall be the permit fees charged for the permits required3

in this section:4

(1) Carnivals, fairs, festivals . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $125.005

(2) Explosives and blasting agents . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.006

(3) Fireworks display . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $175.007
Fireworks stand . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.00/8

     $50.00 Late Fee after 6/109

(4) Flammable combustible liquid tank installation . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 85.00 per tank10
Tank closures . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 85.00 per tank11
Replace product line . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $50.00 per line12

(5) Hazardous materials13
Less than exempt amount . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $100.0014
More than exempt amount . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $175.0015

(6) Storage and use of  liquified liquefied petroleum gases . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 80.0016

(7) Places of assembly 17
50 to 299 (annually) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $100.0018
300 to 999 (annually) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $125.0019
1000 or more (annually) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.0020

(8) Pyrotechnics and special effects material . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $110.0021

(9) Spraying or dipping . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 85.0022

(10) Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 75.0023

(11) Temporary membrane structures, tents, canopies . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $110.0024

(11a) Temporary membrane structures, tents, 25
canopies used as assembly26

1 to 30 days erected . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $110.0027
31 to 60 days erected . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $160.0028
61 to 90 days erected . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $210.0029

-3-



Applications must be submitted at least five days1
before a temporary membrane is erected or a2
$50.00 late fee shall be charged.3

(12) Hotels and motels4
0  to 40 rooms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 85.005
41 to 120 rooms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $110.006
121 to 200 rooms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.007
201 or more rooms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $175.008

(13) Fraternities and Sororities9
0  to 40 rooms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 85.0010
Over 40 rooms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $110.0011

(14) Fire alarm systems12
1 to 30 devices . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 85.0013
31 to 60 devices . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $115.0014
61 to 90 devices . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $145.0015
91 or more devices . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $175.0016

(15) Child care facilities17
1 to 8 children . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 60.0018
9 to 12 children . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 70.0019
13 or more children . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 80.0020

(16) Schools . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $100.0021

(17) Hospitals22
1 to 50 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $125.0023
51 to 100 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.0024
Over 100 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $175.0025
Reinspection (up to one hour) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 75.0026

(18) Nursing Care Facilities27
1 to 50 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $125.0028
51 to 100 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.0029
Over 100 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $175.0030
Reinspection (up to one hour) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 75.0031

(19) Health Care Facilities32
0 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $100.0033
1 to 50 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $  75.0034
51 to 100 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.0035
Over 100 beds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $175.0036
Reinspection (up to one hour) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 75.0037

-4-



(20) Liquor Establishments1
Non-consumption establishment . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $100.002
Consumption establishment . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $125.003
Reinspection . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $100.004

(21) Mobile Home Court5
1 to 25 mobile homes . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $100.006
26 to 50 mobile homes . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $125.007
Over 50 mobile homes . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $150.008
Reinspection (up to one hour) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 75.009

Where work for which a permit is required by this code is started or10
proceeded with prior to obtaining said permit, the fees herein11
specified shall be doubled; but the payment of such double fees shall12
not relieve any person or persons from fully complying  with the13
requirements of this code in the execution of the work or any other14
penalties prescribed herein.15

(22) Reinspection fee/late fee (wrong address, equipment 16
that does not pass inspection, incomplete work, 17
equipment inaccessibility, etc.) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1/2 Permit Fee18

       Minimum  $40.00
19

(23) Late fee assessed if payment is not received20
within 60 days of due date . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $75.00

21
(24) Fee for issuing a duplicate operational or 22

annual permit . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $25.0023

(25) Reinspections not listed and other inspections shall be at actual cost,24
calculated on an hourly rate.25

105.6.3  Expiration.  Every permit issued by the bureau of fire prevention shall under these26

provisions expire by limitation and become null and void if the work authorized by such permit is27

not commenced within 120 days from the date of such permit, or if the work authorized by such28

permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work has commenced for a period of 18029

days. Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained and the fee thereof30

shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for such  work; provided that such suspension31

or abandonment has not exceeded one year. There shall be no credits or refunds given on permits32

which have expired.  Permit holders returning the unused permit prior to the expiration date of the33

permit shall be limited to a maximum refund amounting to two-thirds of the original fee if the34

original fee is was $75.00 or less more.  For permits where the original fee was greater less than35

-5-



$75.00, a $25.00 processing fee will be levied and the remaining fee amount will be refunded to the1

permit holder.2

Sections 105.6.4 through 105.6.46 are deleted.  3

Section 3.  That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by adding4

a new section numbered 19.03.125 to read as follows:5

19.03.125 Section 202 Amended; General Definitions.6

Section 202 of the International Fire Code is amended to add the following definition:7

SKY LANTERNS.  Devices that require a flame which produces heated air trapped in a8

balloon-type covering allowing the device to float in the air.  Sky lanterns shall not include hot-air9

balloons used for transporting persons10

Section 4.  That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by adding11

a new section numbered 19.03.131 to read as follows:12

19.03.131 Section 307.6 Added; Extinguishment Authority.13

Section 307.6 is added to the International Fire Code to read as follows:14

307.6 Extinguishment Authority.  When open burning, recreational fires, or outdoor15

fireplaces create or add to a hazardous situation, the fire code official or the fire department is16

authorized to order extinguishment of the fire.17

Section 5.  That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by adding18

a new section numbered 19.03.132 to read as follows:19

19.03.132 Section 308.1.2.1 Added; Sky Lanterns. 20

Section 308.1.2.1 is added to the International Fire Code to read as follows:21

308.1.2.1 Sky Lanterns.  The sale, lighting of, and release of sky lanterns shall be22

prohibited. 23

-6-



Section 6.  That Section 19.03.135 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and the same1

is hereby repealed.2

19.03.135 Section 903.2.8 Exception Added; Group R Sprinkler Requirements.  3
An exception to Section 903.2.8 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:4
Exception:  A sprinkler system is not required when all of the following conditions exist:5
(1) The building is an R-2 occupancy and contains eight or fewer apartment units.6
(2) Separation is maintained between living units by means of one-hour fire partitions7

creating a complete vertical separation from foundation to roof.8
(3) Each living unit has its own separate exit access independent of other living units.9

Section 7.  That Section 19.03.144 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and the same10

is hereby repealed.11

19.03.144 Section 907.2.9 Amended; Group R-2.12
Section 907.2.9 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:13
907.2.9  Group R-2.  Fire alarm systems and smoke alarms shall be installed in Group R-214

occupancies as required in Sections 907.2.9.1 and 907.2.9.2.  Fire alarms in dormitories, fraternities,15
and sororities shall be monitored by an approved supervising station in accordance with NFPA 72. 16

 907.2.9.1  Manual fire alarm system.  A manual fire alarm system that activates the17
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group R-218
occupancies where:19

1. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located three or more stories above the20
lowest level of exit discharge;21

2. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located more than one story below the22
highest level of exit discharge of exits serving the dwelling unit or sleeping23
unit; or24

3. The building contains more than 16 dwelling units or sleeping units.25
Exceptions:26

1. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings not more than two27
stories in height where all dwelling units or sleeping units and28
contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from each other and29
public or common areas by at least one-hour fire partitions and each30
dwelling unit or sleeping unit has an exit directly to a public way, exit31
court or yard.32

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is33
equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in34
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 and the occupant35
notification appliances will automatically activate throughout he36
notification zones upon a sprinkler water flow.37

3. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings that do not have38
interior corridors serving dwelling units and are protected by an39
approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with40
Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, provided that dwelling units either41

-7-



have a means of egress door opening directly to an exterior exit1
access that leads directly to the exits or are served by open-ended2
corridors designed in accordance with Section 1026.6, Exception 4.3

Section 8.  That Section 19.03.150 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and the same4

is hereby repealed.5

19.03.150 Section 1504.9 Amended; Limited Spraying Spaces.6
Section 1504.9 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:7
1504.9  Limited spraying spaces.  Limited spraying spaces shall comply with Sections8

1504.9.1 through 1504.9.5. 9
1504.1.91  Job size.  The aggregate surface area to be sprayed shall not exceed 910

square feet (0.84m2)11
1504.9.2  Frequency. Spraying operations shall not be of a continuous nature.12
1504.9.3 Ventilation.  Positive mechanical ventilation providing a minimum of six13

complete air changes per hour shall be installed.  Such system shall meet the requirements of this14
code for handling flammable vapors. Explosion venting is not required.15

1504.9.4  Electrical wiring.  Electrical wiring within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the floor16
and 20 feet (6096 mm) horizontally of the limited spraying space shall be designed for Class 1,17
Division 2 locations in accordance with the ICC Electrical Code.18

1504.9.5   All auto body shops spraying a flammable liquid are required to have at19
least one approved paint booth.  20

Section 9.  That Section 19.03.170 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and the same21

is hereby repealed.22

19.03.170 Section 3308.3 Amended; Approved Displays.23
Section 3308.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:24
3308.3   Approved displays.  Approved displays shall include only the approved Division25

1.3G, Division 1.4G, and Division 1.4S fireworks, shall be handled by an approved competent26
operator, and the fireworks shall be arranged, located, discharged and fired in a manner that will not27
pose a hazard to property or endanger any person.  Such firework exhibitions or displays shall be28
limited to 6-inch mortars if fired manually.  The time delay between igniting the mortar fuse and the29
firing of the mortar shall not be less than 5 seconds if fired manually.  30

Section 10.  That Sections 19.03.010 and 19.03.100 of the Lincoln Municipal Code31

as hitherto existing be and the same are hereby repealed.32

Section 11.  Pursuant to Article VII, Section 7 of the City Charter, this ordinance33

shall be posted on the official bulletin board of the City, located on the wall across from the City34

Clerk’s office at 555 S. 10th Street, in lieu of and in place of newspaper publication with notice of35

-8-



passage and such posting to be given by publication one time in the official newspaper by the City1

Clerk.  This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage and publication2

as herein and in the City Charter provided. 3

Introduced by:

____________________________________

Approved as to Form & Legality:

_________________________________
City Attorney

Approved this ___ day of _____________, 2015:

_______________________________________
Mayor

-9-


