C-14-0382

AMENDMENT TO AGREEMENT
CITY OF LINCOLN\LANCASTER COUNTY
ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TIRES, TUBES AND TIRE REPAIR SERVICES
BID NO. 13-175
FIRST RENEWAL

This Amendment is hereby entered into on this __/ &é day of _/Aaqu“ , 2014, by
and between Bauer Built Tire & Service, 7800 North 56" Street, Lincoln, NE 68529-0225
(hereinafter “Contractor”) and Lancaster County and The City of Lincoln (hereinafter “Owners”),
for the purpose of renewing the Contract C-13-0378, dated Augqust 6, 2013 and E.Q. 86307, dated
July 25, 2013, (the "Contract"), for Annual Supply of Tires, Tubes and Tire Repair Services, Bid
No. 13-175, which is made a part hereof by this reference.

WHEREAS, the original term of the Agreement is August 6, 2013 through August 5, 2014,
with the option to renew for three (3) additional one (1) year terms upon written mutual consent of
both parties; and

WHEREAS, the parties wish to renew the agreement to reflect the additional items per
Attachment A, for an additional one (1) year term beginning August 6, 2014 through August 5,
2015; and

WHEREAS, the estimated expenditures for Lancaster County Departments for the term of this
renewal shall not exceed $96,000.00 per year without approval by the Lancaster County Board.

WHEREAS, the estimated expenditures for City Departments for the term of this renewal shall
not exceed $214,000.00 without prior approval by the City of Lincoln.

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual covenants contained in the
Contract, under County Contract C-13-0378 and E.O. 86307, and stated herein the parties agree as
follows:

1. The Contract shall be renewed, to reflect the additional items per Attachment A, for
an additional one (1) year term beginning August 6, 2014 through August 5,

2015.

2. The estimated expenditures for Lancaster County Departments for the term of this
renewal shall not exceed $96,000.00 per year without approval by the Lancaster County
Board.

3. The estimated expenditures for City Departments for the term of this renewal shall not
exceed $214,000.00 without prior approval by the City of Lincoln.

4. All other terms of the Contract, not in conflict with this Amendment, shall remain in full
force and effect.

The Parties do hereby agree to all the terms and conditions of this Amendment. This
Amendment shall be binding upon the parties, their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and
personal representatives, successors, and assigns.
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iN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties do hereby execute this Amendment.

The Board of County Commissioners of
Lancaster County, Nebraska

City of Lincoln, Nebraska

Executeme l 8dayof & L % , 2014

Chris Beutler, Mayor

Lancaster County Attorney

Supplier, please fill in the date and following information and mail back to our office; a faxed

copy is not acceptable.

Company Name: (Please Print)

Bov{/ BuH /}’i [

By: (Please Sign)

By: (Please Print)

%ﬁ\?‘%< CL/}}%@
Jm\; Shdty /

Title: (Please Print)

Ssle

Company Address: (Please Print)

1gon N SLth

Company Phone & Fax: (Please Print))

(400) HLH- D800 [0z 4 1850

E-Mail Address: (Please Print)

}Qﬁt’«»m\q » 5‘[7“‘#5 79 6(}{&/{’_{“@1/1'[%, €0/

Date: (Please Print)

J 4

Contact Person For: “Orders or Service”
(Please Print)

.j Cemn i S/’}c ﬁ}’

Phone Number: (Please Print)

/5 279 -(%ED
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LIN
7800 NORTH 56

LINCOLN, NE 68529-0225

402/464-7800

CUSTOMER : LINCOLN CITY OF
949 W BOND STE 200
767181
LINCOLN NE
68508-3628

FAX NUMBER: 4024418292

WORK : 402/441-5924 0

HOME : 402/441-7705 0

SALESMAN: 84004

ESTIMATE DATE: 06/25/14 DUE: 07/15/14

LT26570R17 E TRANSFORCE AT OWL 1 137.39

FI200190
24555R18 FH GT Z PURSUIT BW 103W i 123.43

FI000177
31580R225 L HSU2 WT 1 505.85
CN05140450000

ESTIMATE #:

ATTACHMENT A

42581

1

MERCHANDISE: 766.67

ESTIMATE TOTAL: T766.677
FrEE&XEXATHIS I8 NOT AN INVOICE**#%&xxk%
¥xkkkxk¥DO NOT PAY FROM THIS FORM®* *% %k * %

Thank you for your business.
To register your tires go to www.bauerbuilt.com

eayments are gue and paysbis by the W87 doy of the montr, 10
of 1 4% per month [ARNUAL PERCERTAGE RATE 1890
baiznce less 3l payments and credits made i fasrp

CUSTOMER SIGRATURE

Thank You for your business. Retorgue lug nuts after 50-100 miles.
y of the month e FINAKCE CBARGE
ten Lalance s the previous

DaYment s NOT TeCeives by the 157 da

ted balarce will be sddod. The adu

FRINT

www . bauerbuilt.com
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C-13-0378

CONTRACT DOCUMENTS

CITY OF LINC OLN/LANCASTER COUNTY
NEBRASKA

ANNUAL SUPPLY
OF
Tires, Tubes and Tire Repair Services
Bid No. 13-175

Bauer Built Tire & Service
7800 North 56" Street
Lincoln, NE 68529-0225
(402)464-7800




CITY OF LINCOLN/LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA
CONTRACT AGREEMENT

THIS CONTRACT, made and entered into this 6 day of AUQUSt 2013, by and

between Bauer Built Tire & Service, 7800 North 56 Street, Lincoln, NE 68529-0225 , hereinafter
called “Contractor”, and the City of Lincoin, Nebraska, a municipal corporation, and the County of

Lancaster, Nebraska, a political subdivision of the State of Nebraska, hereinafter called the “Owners’.

WHEREAS, the Owner has caused to be prepared, in accordance with law, Specifications, Plans,
and other Contract Documents for the Work herein described, and has approved and adopted said
documents and has caused to be published an advertisement for and in connection with said Work, to-wit:

For providing _Annual Supply of Tires, Tubes and Tire Repair Services, Bid No. 13-175 and,

WHEREAS, the Contractor, in response to such advertisement, has submitted to the Owners, in
the manner and at the time specified, a sealed Proposal/Supplier Response in accordance with the terms
of said advertisement; and,

WHEREAS, the Owners, in the manner prescribed by law has publicly opened, read aloud,
examined, and canvassed the Proposals/Supplier Responses submitted in response to such
advertisement, and as a result of such canvass has determined and declared the Contractor to be the
lowest responsible bidder for the said Work for the sum or sums named in the Contractor's
Proposal/Supplier Responses, a copy thereof being attached to and made a part of this Contract;

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the sums to be paid to the Contractor and the mutual
covenants herein contained, the Contractor and the Owners have agreed and hereby agree as follows:

1. The Contractor agrees to (a) furnish all tools, equipment, supplies, superintendence,
transportation, and other accessories, services, and facilities; (b) furnish all materials, supplies,
and equipment specified to be incorporated into and form a permanent part of the complete work;
(c) provide and perform all necessary labor in a substantial and workmanlike manner and in
accordance with the provisions of the Contract Documents; and (d) execute and complete all
Work included in and covered by the Owners’ award of this Contract to the Contractor, such
award being based on the acceptance by the Owner of the Contractor's Proposal, or part thereof,
as follows:

Agreement to full proposal

2. The Owners agree to pay to the Contractor for the performance of the Work embraced in this
Contract, the Contractor agrees to accept as full compensation therefore, the following sums and
prices for all Work covered by and included in the Contract award and designated above, payment
thereof to be made in the manner provided by the Owners:

The Owners will pay for products/service, according to the Line ltem pricing as listed in
Contractors Proposal/Supplier Response, a copy thereof being attached to and made a
part of this Contract. The Owners shall order on an as- needed basis for the duration of the
contract. The total cost of products or services for County agencies shall not exceed

$ 50,000.00 during the contract term without approval by the Board of Commissioners. The
total cost of products or services for City Departments shall not exceed $100,000.00
during the contract term without approval.
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3 Equal Employment Opportunity. In connection with the carrying out of this project, the contractor
shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of race, color,
religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, disability, age or marital status. The Contractor will take
affirmative action to ensure that applicants are employed, and that employees are treated during
employment, without regard to their race, color, religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, disability,
age or marital status. Such action shall include, but not be limited to, the following: employment,
upgrading, demotion or transfer; recruitment or recruitment advertising; layoff or termination: rates
of pay or other compensation; and selection for training, including apprenticeship.

4. E-Verify. Inaccordance with Neb. Rev. Stat. 4-108 through 4-114, the contractor agrees to
register with and use a federal immigration verification system, to determine the work eligibility
status of new empioyees performing services within the state of Nebraska. A federal immigration
verification system means the electronic verification of the work authorization program of the
lilegal Immigration Reform and Immigrant Responsibility Act of 1996, 8 U.S.C. 1324 a, otherwise
known as the E-Verify Program, or an equivalent federal program designated by the United States
Department of Homeland Security or other federal agency authorized to verify the work eligibility
status of a newly hired employee pursuant to the Immigration Reform and Control Act of 1986.
The Contractor shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment to be
employed in the performance of this section pursuant to the requirements of state law and 8
U.S.C.A 1324b. The contractor shall require any subcontractor to comply with the provisions of
this section.

5. Termination. This Contract may be terminated by the following:
5.1)  Termination for Convenience. Either party may terminate this Contract upon thirty (30)
days written notice to the other party for any reason without penalty.
5.2)  Termination for Cause. The Owners may terminate the Contract for cause if the

Contractor:

5.2.1) Refuses or fails to supply the proper labor, materials and equipment necessary to
provide services and/or commodities.

5.2.2) Disregards Federal, State or local laws, ordinances, regulations, resolutions or
orders.

5.2.3) Otherwise commits a substantial breach or default of any provision of the
Contract Document. In the event of a substantial breach or default the Owners
will provide the Contractor written notice of said breach or default and allow the
Contractor ten (10) days from the date of the written notice to cure such breach or
default. If said breach or default is not cured within ten (10) days from the date of
notice, then the contract shall terminate.

6. Independent Contractor. It is the express intent of the parties that this contract shall not create an
employer-employee relationship. Employees of the Contractor shall not be deemed to be
employees of the Owners and employees of the Owners shall not be deemed to be employees of
the Contractor. The Contractor and the Owners shall be responsible to their respective
employees for all salary and benefits. Neither the Contractor's employees nor the Owners’
employees shall be entitled to any salary, wages, or benefits from the other party, including but not
limited to overtime, vacation, retirement benefits, workers’ compensation, sick leave or injury
leave. Contractor shall also be responsible for maintaining workers’ compensation insurance,
unemployment insurance for its employees, and for payment of all federal, state, local and any
other payroll taxes with respect to its employees’ compensation.

7. Owner Inclusion. It is understood and agreed by all parties that “Owner/s” shall include the City of
Lincoln and Lancaster County, Nebraska. Whenever in the Contract documents, including the
instructions to bidders, specifications, insurance requirements, bonds, and terms and conditions
or any other documents which are a part of the Contract, a singular entity is referenced (i.e., “the
City” or “the County") it shall mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of Lincoln, and Lancaster
County.
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8. Contract Term. This Contract shall be effective August 1, 2013 thru July 31', 2014. The term of

the Contract shall be a one (1) year term with option to renew for three (3) additional one (1) year
terms.

9. The Contract Documents comprise the Contract, and consist of the following:
1. Contract Agreement

. Accepted Proposal/Supplier Response

Addendums No. 1

Special Provisions

Specifications

Instructions to Bidders

Insurance Requirements

Authorized Distributor Certificate and Net State Price List

Sales Tax Exemption Form 13

CoNohLN

These Contract Agreements, together with the other Contract Documents herein above
mentioned, form this Contract, and they are as fully a part of the Contract as if hereto attached or herein
repeated.

The Contractor and the Owners hereby agree that all the terms and conditions of this Contract
shall be binding upon themselves, and their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal
representatives, successors, and assigns.

INWITNESS WHEREOF, the Contractor and the Owners do hereby execute this contract.

EXECUTION BY THE CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA

CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA

e
W

Mayor

086307

Approved by Executive No._

Dated &\LL\&‘I %ID@G

EXECUTION BY LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA

Contract Approved as to Form: The Board of County Commissioners of

. MM} Lanc Nebras
B / ,,;/a?‘)hﬁmd r
\ LA 1N -
y
N )
oues £ 10)/
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EXECUTION BY CONTRACTOR

IF A CORPORATION: 80&0@( GJ. (‘(/ (3}(\(_
STRL

Name of Corporation

ATTEST: PN
(SEAL) (Addﬁ ‘)g it 2
ress ) - -
Secretary (S Q\ N ZE bg§ 26
By: U 4 ‘
Duly Authorized Official

[CANR- N V) er
Legal Title of Official *

{F OTHER TYPE OF ORGANIZATION:

Name of Organization

Type of Organization

(Address)
By:
Member

By
Member

IF AN INDIVIDUAL

Name

Address

Signature
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)

Bid Information

Supplier Response

Contact information

Ship to Information

Bid Creator Sharon R. Mulder Asst
Purchasing Agent

Emait smulder@lincoln.ne.gov

Phone (402) 441-7410

Fax (402) 441-6513

Bid Number  13-175 Addendum 1

Title Tires, Tubes and Tire Repair
Services

Bid Type Bid

Issue Date 05/30/2013

Close Date 6/13/2013 12:00:00 PM CT

Need by Date

Supplier information

Address Purchasing
440 S. 8th St.
Lincoln, NE 68508
Sharon R. Mulder Asst
Purchasing Agent
Purchasing
Department
Building

Contact

Suite 200
Floor/Room
Telephone (402) 441-7428
Fax (402) 441-6513
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov

Address

Contact

Department
Building

Floor/Room
Telephone

Fax

Email

Company Bauer Built Tire & Service
Address 7800 North 56th
Lincoln, NE 68529-0225
Contact
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone 1(402) 464-7800
Fax 1(402) 464-7880
Email
Submitted 6/13/2013 10:40:13AMCT
Total $460,959.78
Signature

Supplier Notes

Insurance and exempt forms should already be on file, any items that could not be downloaded will be brought to you on hard

copy.
Bid Notes

Bid Activities

Bid Messages

Please review the following and respond where necessary

13-175 Addendum 1 - Page 1 of 24



10

11

12

13

14

15

Renewa! is an Option

Special Provision Term Contract Provisions

Term Clause of Contract

Response Time

Mileage

References

Manufacturer's Net State Price List

Authorized Distributor Certificate

Off-Road Tire Repair Price Sheet

Bid award

Contract Extenstion Renewal is an option.

I acknowledge and accepl reading and understanding the
Special Provision Term Contract Provisions.

| acknowledge and accept that the term of the contract is
for a one (1) year term with the option for three (3)
additional one (1) year renewals from the date of the
executed contract.

. <BR>{(a) Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year
contract period. YES or NO<BR>

(b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation/de-escalation
YES or NO<BR>

(c) If {b), state period for which prices will remain firm:
thraugh

State your normal response time for service calls.

Do you charge additional for mileage when a City/County
vehicle needs a tire repair outside of the City limits? Yes
of No<br>If yes, please state your rate.

I have attached my References fo the Response
Attachment section of this bid if my company has not done
business with the City of Lincoln or Lancaster County for
the past three (3) years and per specifications, Section
14.

Attached is & copy of the Manufacturer's Net State Price
List in the Response Attachment Section of the
E-bid.<br>Yes or No

Attached is a current cerfificate with an authorized
signature from the Tire Manufacturer stating the Vendor is
an Authorized Distributor for each brand of tire referenced
in the bid proposal in the Response Attachment Section of
the E-bid.

| have attached an Off-Road Tire Repair Price Sheet as an
attachment in the Vendors Response Attachment Section
of the ebid. Referenced in Specifications, Section 17.

| acknowledge and accept that the City, County and/or
Public Buiflding Commission reserves the right to award
bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options, by
groups, or "lump sum” such as shall best serve the
requirements and interests of the City, County and/or
Public Building Commission.<br><br>

If your pricing is based on an all-or-nothing basis, please
indicate so in the Supplier Notes section of your E-Bid
response.

Name Note Response

instructions to Bidders | acknowledge and accept reading and understanding the  Yes
nstructions to Bidders.

Insurance Requirements { acknowledge and accept reading and understanding the  Yes
insurance Requirements.

Sample Contract | acknowledge and accept reading and understanding the  Yes
sample contract.

Specifications It acknowledge and accept reading and understanding the Yes
specifications.

Contact Name of person submitting this bid:

Jeremy Shutts
Yes

Yes

service pricing is, tire prices subject
o manufacturer's programs

1 hour

yes, 2 per mile

Yes

Will have hard copiss of
Manufacturer's Net State Price Lists

Yes

labor rates given

Yes

13-175 Addendum 1 - Page 2 of 24



18

17

18

19

20

21

22

Quantities

Warranty

Numbers in Price Box

Tax Exempt Certification Forms

Requested Attachments

Electronic Signature

Agreement to Addendum No. 1

1 acknowledge and accept that the quantities listed for Y

each line item are an estimated yearly amount. The Ci

ity

does not guarantee any dollar amount or order quantities

for the term of the contract.

I acknowledge that a copy of the Manufacturer's Publi

shed YES

Warranty is attached in the Response Attachment Section

of the ebid.

<b> | acknowledge, understand and hereby verify that Yes
ONLY numbers have been typed into the Unit Price box in

the Line Item section of this ebid response, | further
understand that if any symbols or letters {other than a
decimal point for dollars and cents) have been typed |
the Unit Price box that it will result in my bid showing
amount of $0 for respective line items. <b>

nto
an

Materials being purchased in this bid are tax exempt and ~ Yes

unit prices are reflected as such. A Purchasing Agent

Appointment form and a Exempt Sales Certificate form

shall be issued with contract documents. (Note: State
Law does not provide for sales tax exemption for

Tax

proprietary functions for government, thereby excluding
the purchases of pipes to be installed in water lines and

purchase of water meters.)

| acknowledge and accept that the requested attachments  JS, any that can't be uploaded wilt

throughout the Specifications and Bid Attributes are
attached in the Vendors Response Section of the E-b

be brought in on paper
id,

your bid maybe considered "Non-Responsive” and not
eligible for award.<br>Response shall be your initials that

you understand.
Please check here for your electronic signature.

Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth

Yes

in Yes

this addendum has been incorporated in their proposal and
is part of their bid. <br>Reason: See Bid Attachments

section for Addendum information.

13-175 Addendum 1 - Page 3 of 24



Line ltems

# Qi  UOM  Description Response

1 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P195/70R14 $0.00
Manufacturer: Firestone Manufacturer #: FR380
Item Notes:
Supplier Notes: FR380 no longer made
item Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessaryk
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone fr380

Alt1 6 EA Alt Spec: alternate 70.44
Alt Manufacturer: Bridgestone insignia se200 Alt Manufacturer #: bridgestone
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ftem Afiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary ) o ~
#  Name _ Note ___ Response B
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model bridgestone Insignia SE200

2 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P205/60R 16 $81.27
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary R )
#  Name Note Response B
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Uniroyal Tiger Paw Touring

3 25 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P205/65R15 $74.24
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

ltem Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#_ Name . Note

Response

1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model

Firestone FR710
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Alt 1

25 EA Alt Spec: MADE INUSA

70.92
Alt Manufacturer: Hercules Roadtour 655 Alt Manufacturer #: Hercules
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note _ Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Hercules Roadtour 655
4 [ EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P205/75R14 $76.55
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes; Please review the following and respond where necessary -
# _ Name Note Response -
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Uniroyal Tiger Paw AWPII
Alt1 8 EA Alt Spec: MADE IN USA 62.89
Alt Manufacturer: Hercules Touring 4.0 Alt Manufacturer #: Hercules
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
Item Attributes; Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note _ Response
1 Manufacturer / Modet List Manufacturer / Model Hercules Touring 4.0
5 18 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P205/75R 15 $79.84
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary )
#  Name ) Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Uniroyal Tiger Paw AWPII
Alt1 15 EA Alt Spec: Made in USA 73.08

Alt Manufacturer: Hercules Touring 4.0 Alt Manufacturer # Hercules
lter Notes:

Supplier Notes:

13-175 Addendum 1 - Page 5 of 24



item Attributes: Please review the foliowing%nd respond where necessary

# Name Note

Response

1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model

Hercules Touring 4.0

6 20 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P215/60R15 $79.84
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ftem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary -
# _ Name Note . Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Modet Uniroyal Tiger Paw Touring

Alt1 20 EA Alt Spec: Made in USA 66.88
Alt Manufacturer: Hercules Touring 4.0 Alt Manufacturer #: Herucles
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name e Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Mode! Hercules Touring 4.0

7 15 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P215/60R18 $75.10
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
Item Altributes; Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note __Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone FR710

Altt 15 EA Alt Spec: Made in USA 75.10

Alt Manufacturer: Hercules Touring 4.0
item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Alt Manufacturer #: Hercules

ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note

_Response

1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model

Hercules Touring 4.0
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8 15 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P215/70R15 $72.56
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response N
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone FR710

Alt1 15 EA Alt Spec: Made in USA 67.41
Alt Manufacturer: Hercules Alt Manufacturer #: Hercules
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary B
#  Name Note 3 Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Hercules Touring 4.0

9 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P2356/75R 15 $100.91
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response -
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Destination LE2

Alt1 6 EA Alt Spec: Made in USa 85.94
Alt Manufacturer: Hercules Alt Manufacturer #: Hercules
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
Eem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary o 3
#__ Name Note Response T
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Hercules Touring 4.0

10 18 EA Auto/l.ight Truck Tire, P225/70R15 $87.99
ltem Notes: -

Supplier Notes:
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item Atfributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# o Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Destinaton LE2
11 580 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P225/60R16 $98.20
Manufacturer: Firestone Manufacturer #: Firehawk PVS - Snow
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary - i -
#  Name Note ) Response 3
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Modsel Firestone Firehawk PVS
12 172 EA Autd/Light Truck Tire, P225/60R18 $121.79
Manufacturer: Firestone Manufacturer #: Firehawk PVS - Snow
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Modet Firestone Firehawk PVS
13 216 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P235/55R17 $112.48
Manufacturer: Firestone Manufacturer # Firehawk PVS - Snow
liem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
Eém Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# . Name Note i Response
1 Manufacturer / Modet List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Firehawk PVS
14 8 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P235/70R16 $103.34
item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

ltem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# Name Note

Response

1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Mode!

Firestone Destination LE2
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15

6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P235/70R17
item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

$101.92

Item Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Destination LE2

16 15 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P235/75R16 $101.24
item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

ltem Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note Response
1 Manufaciurer / Model List Manufacturer / Model BF Goodrich Long Trail Touring
17 216 EA AutofLight Truck Tire, P245/65R 18 No Bid

Manufacturer: Firestone Manufacturer #: Firehawk PVS - Snow

item Notes: <br>**Note: This tire will not to be stocked at this time, due fo the fact we have spare tires on hand from the
vehicles.<br>Once those are used up, the average yearly quantity will be this.<br>Do not order until you hear

differently from us.

Supplier Notes: Tire not currently available in this size, but once available bid will be on current government pricing

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respof{d where necessary

#__ Name i Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model
18 156 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P245/75R16 $112.07
Item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Afiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Destination LE2
19 10 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P255/70R16 $114.11
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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#  Name Note _ Response )
1 Manufacturer / Model ~ List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Destination LE2

20 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P265/70R16 $114.56
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
Item Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary .
#  Name Note ~ Response o
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Destination LE2

21 10 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, P285/70R17 $112.32
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#__ Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Modet Firestone Destination LE2

22 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT215/75R18 $116.88
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note " ° Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model BF Goodrich AR Terrain TA

23 28 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT225/70R16 $168.64
Manufacturer: Michelin
Item Notes: <br>For Handi-Vans
Supplier Notes: believe the right size is LT225/75R16, Michelin does not have a LT225/70R16.
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# _ Name Note B Response B
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Michelin LTX M/S2 LRE

24 15 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT225/75R16 $111.53
item Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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¥ Name

1 Manufacturer / Mode!

.. Note

Response

List Manufacturer / Model

Firestone Transforce HT

25 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT235/75R15 $103.66
tem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
|terﬁ Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name - Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Transforce HY

26 12 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT235/85R16 $114.80
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary -
#  Name Note . @ Response -
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Mode! Firestone Transforce HT

27 45 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT245/75R16 $110.11
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary T N
#_Name Note Response ]
1 Manufacturer / Mode! List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Transforce HT

28 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT245/70R17 $120.24
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and resbond where necessary
# Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Mode! Firestone Transforce HT

29 16 EA AutofLight Truck Tire, LT245/70R17 All Terrain Load Range -E $161.29

Manufacturer: BF Goodrich
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Manufacturer # Rugged Trail T/A
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ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# _Name . Note _ Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model BF Goodrich Rugged Trail T/A
30 12 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT245/75R16 Traction Load Range - E $159.44
Manufacturer: BF Goodrich Manufacturer #: Commerical T/A Traction
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model bList Manufacturer / Model BF Goodrich Commercial T/A
Traction
31 6 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT245/75R16 All Season Load Range - E $147.64
Manufacturer: BF Goodrich Manufacturer #: Commerical T/A All Season
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary B
#  Name Note Response -
1 Manufacturer / Modei List Manufacturer / Model BF Goodrich Comm T/A All Season
32 8 EA Auto/Light Truck Tire, LT265/70R17 $134.18
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary i -
#  Name ~ Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Transforce HT
33 200 EA Pursuit Rated, P225/60R16-97V Pursuit $94.21

Manufacturer: Firestone

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Manufacturer #: Firehawk GTz Pursui

Item Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# -

1

Name

Note

___Response

Manufaciurer / Model

List Manufacturer / Model

Firestone Firehawk GTZ Pursuit
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34

8 EA Pursuit Rated, P225/60R18-98W Pursuit
Manufacturer: Firestone Manufacturer #: Firehawk GTz Pursuit
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

$111.27

ltem Ailributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# Name Note

Response

1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Modet

Firestone Firehawk GTZ Pursuit

3B 24 EA Pursuit Rated, P235/50R18-99W Pursuit $132.05
Manufacturer: Firestohe Manufacturer #: Firehawk GTz Pursuit
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary o
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Firehawk GTZ Pursuit

36 200 EA Pursuit Rated, P235/55R17-98W Pursuit $107.54
Manufacturer: Firestone Manufacturer #: Firehawk GTz Pursuit
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name ~_Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Firestone Firehawk GTZ Pursuit

37 30 EA Heavy Truck Tire, 225/70R19.5 $231.02
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary T
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model BF Goodrich ST230 14ply

38 75 EA Heavy Truck Tire, 11R22.5, Highway LRG $337.60
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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... Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model General 8371 LRH
39 125 EA Heavy Truck Tire, 11R22.5, Traction LRG $361.81
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
i@%?\tiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary }
#  Name - Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model General D660 LRG
40 75 EA Heavy Truck Tire, 11R22.5, Highway LRH $337.60
item Notes:
’Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary o
#  Name __Note o Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Mode! General S371 LRH
41 125 EA Heavy Truck Tire, 11R22.5, Traction LRH $370.20
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# _Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model General D660 L.RH
42 10 EA Heavy Truck Tire, 315/80R22.5 Steer Tread Load Range - L $500.85
Manufacturer: Continental Manufacturer #: HSU2+
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# Name Note

Response

1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model

Continental HSU2+ LRL
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Alt1 10 EA Alt Spec: Made by Continental 485.62
Alt Manufacturer: General Alt Manufacturer #: Grabber OA It}
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ilem Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary ~
# Name L - Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model General Grabber OA LRL
43 30 EA Radial Transit Tires, Size: 275/70 R22.5 $482.86
Manufacturer: Michelin or Goodyear Manufacturer #: XZU2 or Metro Miler
{fem Notes: <br>Purchase Price
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and ”rmgspond where necessary
#  Name Note Response -
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Michelin XZU2
2 Ply and Load Range List the Ply and Load Range for tire bid. load range J
44 40 EA Radial Transit Tires, Size: 305/85 R22.5 $747.02
Manufacturer: Michelin or Goodyear Manufacturer #: XZU3 or Metro Miler
Item Notes: <pr>Purchase Price
Supplier Notes:
Iltem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# _ Name Note ~ Response
1 Manufacturer / Mode! List Manufacturer / Model Michelin XZU3
2 Ply and Load Range List the Ply and Load Range of tire bid. load range J
45 50 EA Recaps No Bid

Manufacturer. Bandag Waste Hauler Rib
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes: No size given for recap, taking a guess at size

13-175 Addendum 1 - Page 15 of 24



Alt 1

50 EA Alt Spec: Michelin XZY3, Michelin equivalent, similar tread design and tread depth for size of 184.18

275/70R22 .5
Alt Manufacturer: Michelin Alt Manufacturer #: XZY3
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

46

70 EA Tire Carcass Fee, Pick-up and Disposal $0.00
ltem Notes: <br>if you charge no fee for this service, put a 0 in the Line ltem and state "no charge” in the Supplier Notes
section of the Line ltem.
Supplier Notes: no charge, 1 to 1
47 40 EA Grader Tire, 14.00R24-1* Tubeless G2 $1,199.00
Iltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Michelin XGLAZ2
48 12 EA Grader Tire, 14.00-24-12 Ply Tubeless G2 $472.98
tem Notes:
Supplier Notes;
Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Solideal Grader G2 12ply
49 26 EA Grader Tire, 14.00R24 Tubeless $1,204.28

Manufacturer: Bridgestone Manufacturer # V-Steel Ultra Traction
ltem Notes: <br>No Exceptions!

Supplier Notes:

item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note

Response

1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model

Bridgestone VUT
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50 20 EA Loader Tire, 20.5-25-12 Ply, Tubeless L2 $820.50
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# _ Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model! List Manufacturer / Model Solideal Loader L2 16ply
51 2 EA Loader Tire, 650/65R-1*, Tubeless 1.3 $3,891.89
tem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the foliowing and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Modet List Manufacturer / Model Michelin XLD 1* L3
52 2 EA Scraper Tire, 33.25R-2*, Tubeless E3 $9,096.32
ttem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
item Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary )
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Michelin XTS 2* E3
53 6 EA Trailer Tire, ST22675R 15 $99.69
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
e Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer / Model List Manufacturer / Model Hercules Power Radial Trailer LRD
54 1 EA Installation Charge for Automotive and Light Truck Tires $8.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
55 1 EA Balancing Charge for Autormnotive and Light Truck Tires $4.00
{tem Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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56 1 EA installation Charge for Heavy Truck Tires _ $20.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:

57 1 EA Balancing Charge for Heavy Truck Tires $15.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:

58 1 EA Installation Charge for Grader Tires $45.00
tem Notes:
Supplier Notes:

59 1 EA Installation Charge for Loader Tires $65.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:

60 1 EA Installation Charge for Scrapper Tires $75.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes: per hour

61 1 EA Flat Repair for Autornotive/Light Truck Tires during Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., $15.00

Monday thru Friday

tem Notes: <br>Flat Repair to include all fabor, shop supplies and environmental charges, removal, repair and mounting.
Supplier Notes: up to 3 nail holes, additional $1.00 for labor, $1.00 for parts, for each additional hole that needs repairing after that

62 1 EA Flat Repair for Automobile/Light Truck Tires after Regular Hours, Weekends and Holidays $75.00
ltem Notes: <br>Flat Repair to include all fabor, shop supplies and environmental charges, removal, repair and mounting.
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum

63 1 EA Flat Repair for Medium/Heavy Truck Tires during Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., $25.00

Monday thru Friday

ftem Notes: <br>Flat Repair to include all labor, shop supplies and environmental charges, removal, repair and mounting.

Supplier Notes:
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64 1 EA Flat Repair for Medium/Heavy Truck Tires after Regular Hours, Weekends and Holidays $75.00
ltem Notes: <br>Flat Repair to include all labor, shop supplies and environmental charges, removal, repair and mounting.
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum

65 1 EA Flat Repair for Industrial and Farm Tires during Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., $4.00

Monday thru Friday
ltem Notes: <br>Flat Repair to include all labor, shop supplies and environmental charges, removal, repair and mounting.
Supplier Notes: charged per section width (ie 18.4R38 18.4 x 4 = $73.60,
11.2-24 11.2x 4 = $44.80)

66 1 EA Flat Repair for Industrial and Farm Tires after Regular Hours, Weekends and Holidays $75.00
ltem Notes: <br>Flat Repair to include afl labor, shop supplies and environmental charges, removal, repair and mounting.
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum

67 1 EA Discount for the Repair of Grader/Loader Tires from the Tire Repair Price Schedule No Bid
tem Notes: Attach a Tire Repair Price Schedule into the response attachments portion of this e-bid.

Supplier Notes:
68 1 EA Discount for the Repair of Scraper Tires from the Tire Repair Price Schedule No Bid
Iltem Notes: Attach a Tire Repair Price Schedule into the response attachments portion of this e-bid.
Supplier Notes:
69 1 EA Tire Rotation for Automobile/Light Truck Tires during Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. 1o 4;30 p.m., $5.00
Monday thru Friday ~
liem Notes: <br>Tire Rotation to include all labor and shop supplies
Supplier Notes:

70 1 EA Tire Rotation for Automobile/Light Truck Tires after Regular Hours, Weekends and Holidays $75.00
ltern Notes: <br>Tire Rotation 1o include all labor and shop supplies
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum

711 EA Tire Rotation for Medium/Heavy Truck Tires during Regufar Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., $11.00

Monday thru Friday
ftem Notes: <br>Tire Rotation to include all labor and shop supplies

Supplier Notes:
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72

1 EA Tire Rotation for Medium/Heavy Truck Tires after Regular Hours, Weekends and Holidays $75.00
ltem Notes: <br>Tire Rotation to include all labor and shop supplies
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum
73 1 EA Tire Rotation for industrial and Farm Tires during Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4;30 p.m., $65.00
Monday thru Friday
ltem Notes: <br>Tire Rotation to include all labor and shop supplies
Supplier Notes: per hour
74 1 EA Tire Rotation for Industrial and Farm Tires after Regular Hours, Weekends and Holidays $75.00
ltem Notes: <br>Tire Rotation to include all labor and shop supplies
Supplier Notes: per hour 2 hour minimum
75 1 EA Tire Rotation of Grader/Loader Tires $65.00
tem Notes: <br>Tire Rotation to include all labor and shop supplies
Supplier Notes: per hour
76 1 EA Tire Rotation of Scraper Tires $75.00
item Notes: <br>Tire Rotation to include all labor and shop supplies
Supplier Notes: per hour
77 1 EA Discount from the Manufacturer's Net State Price List for Auto/Light Truck Tires not 45.00%
specifically addressed.
Iltem Notes:
Supplier Notes: Varies between manufacturer programs, and specific tires, but all programs will be used. We utilize, Michelin/BF
Goodrich/Uniroyal, and Bridgestone/Firesto
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary R
#__ Name - _Note Response
1 Manufacturer Manufacturer Michelin
2 Net State Price List No. Provide the Net State Price List Number to include the List 1224885 4/1/13 - 3/31/14
Date.
78 1 EA Discount from the Manufacturer's Net State Price List for Special High Performance (Police 0.00%

Pursuit) Tires not specifically addressed.

itern Notes:
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Supplier Notes: Manufacturer's price sheet

ftem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note _ Response
1 Manufacturer Manufacturer Bridgestone, Firestone
2 Net State Price List No. Provide the Net State Price List Number to include the List 7140 price list attached. Valid
Date. 4/1/2013 through 3/31/2014
79 1 EA Discount from the Manufacturer's Net State Price List for Heavy Truck (Class 6, 7 and 50.00%
8)<br>Tires not specifically addressed.
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes: Alsoc Continental/General #GNEG3AAS & #GNEG3AAB
E&m Atiributes: Please review the fqﬁiqwiu'sméhand respond where necessary
#  Name  Note __ Response
1 Manufacturer Manufacturer Michelin
2 Net State Price List No. Provide the Net State Price List Number to include the List 1224885 4/1/13 - 3/31/14
Date.
80 1 EA Discount from the Manufacturer's Net State Price List for Off-The Road (Earth Mover, 37.00%
Grader)<br>Tires not specifically addressed.
tem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer Manufacturer Michelin
2 Net State Price List No. Provide the Net State Price List Number to include the List 1224885 4/1/13 - 3/31/14
Date.
81 1 EA Discount from the Manufacturer's Net State Price List for Farm Specialty (Ag 48.00%

Traclor)<br>Tires not specifically addressed.
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#'H Name Note o Response

1 Manufacturer Manufacturer Michelin

2 Net State Price List No. Provide the Net State Price List Number 1o include the List 1224885 4/1/13 - 3/31/14
Date.
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82 1 EA Repair Service Call During Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., Monday thru Friday for $35.00
Automotive/Light Trucks
ftem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary ) o
#  Name Note Response
1 Service Call Please tell us what is included in this price. service call
83 1 EA Repair Service Call After Hours/Weekends for Automotive/light Trucks $75.00
tem Notes:
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum
item Attributes: Please review the following and rééﬁbnd where necessary
# Neme __ Note Response B
1 Service Call Please tell us what is included in this price. service call, all work performed,
mileage
84 1 EA Repair Service Call During Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., Monday thru Friday for $35.00
: Medium/Heavy Trucks
tem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# _ Name Note B ... Response
1 Service Call Please teli us what is included in this price. service call
85 1 EA Repair Service Call After Hours/Weekends for Medium/Heavy Trucks $75.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum
ltem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
fL._, Name Note Response
1 Service Call Please teil us what is included in this price. service call, all work performed,
mileage
86 1 EA Repair Service Call During Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., Monday thru Friday for $35.00

Industrial Farm Tractors and Trailers
item Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and responid where necessary

# Name Note _Response -
i Service Call Please tell us what is included in this price. service call
87 1 EA Repair Service Call After Hours/Weekends for Industrial Farm Tractors and Trailers $75.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary N
# Name Note 3 Response
1 Service Call Please tell us what is included in this price. service call, all work performed,
mileage
88 1 EA Repair Service Call During Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. {0 4:30 p.m., Monday thru Friday for $75.00
Graders/l.oaders
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary -
#  Name Note Response
1 Service Cali Please tell us what is included in this price. service call
89 1 EA Repair Service Call After Hours/Weekends for Graders/Loaders $75.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum
Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary -
#__ Name Note @ Response )
1 Service Cali Please tell us what is included in this price. service call, all work performed,
mileage
80 1 EA Repair Service Call During Regular Hours, 8:00 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., Monday thru Friday for $75.00
Scrapers
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Htem Attributes; Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name N Note N Response

1 Service Call Please teli us what is included in this price. service call

13-175 Addendum 1 - Page 23 of 24



g1 1 EA Repair Service Call After Hours/Weekends for Scrapers $100.00
item Notes:
Supplier Notes: per hour, 2 hour minimum
ftem Atlributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name Note Response
1 Service Call Please telf us what is included in this price. service call, work performed,
mileage
g2 1 Hour Off-the-Road Labor Rate $75.00
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
ltem Alfributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
Note Response
1 Labor Rate Please tell us what is included in this price. work performed
Response Total; $460,959.78
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