CONTRACT DOCUMENTS

CITYOFLINCOLN
NEBRASKA

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS
FOR
Lincoln Fire and Rescue Department Uniforms with
Web-Based Ordering System
Bid No. 14-102

MES - Mid America
1880 East Military Ave.
Fremont, NE 68025
(402)727-5785




CITY OF LINCOLN
CONTRACT AGREEMENT

THIS CONTRACT, made and entered into this day of 2014, by and
between MES - Mid America, 1880 East Military Ave., Fremont, NE 68025, hereinafter called
“Contractor”, and the City of Lincoln, Nebraska, a municipal corporation, hereinafter called “City".

WHEREAS, the City has caused to be prepared, in accordance with law, Specifications, Plans,
and other Contract Documents for the Work herein described, and has approved and adopted said
documents and has caused to be published an advertisement for and in connection with said Work, to-wit:

For providing Lincoln Fire and Rescue Department Uniforms with a Web-Based Ordering
System, Bid No. 14-102 and,

WHEREAS, the Contractor, in response to such advertisement, has submitted to the City, in the
manner and at the time specified, a sealed Proposal/Supplier Response in accordance with the terms of
said advertisement; and,

WHEREAS, the City, in the manner prescribed by law has publicly opened, read aloud, examined,
and canvassed the Proposals/Supplier Responses submitted in response to such advertisement, and as a
result of such canvass has determined and declared the Contractor to be the lowest responsible bidder for
the said Work for the sum or sums named in the Contractor's Proposal/Supplier Responses, a copy
thereof being attached to and made a part of this Contract;

NOW, THEREFORE, in considerétion of the sums to be paid to the Contractor and the mutual
covenants herein contained, the Contractor and the City has agreed and hereby agree as follows:

1. The Contractor agrees to (a) furnish all tools, equipment, supplies, superintendence,
transportation, and other accessories, services, and facilities; (b) furnish all materials, supplies,
and equipment specified to be incorporated into and form a permanent part of the complete work:
(c) provide and perform all necessary labor in a substantial and workmanlike manner and in
accordance with the provisions of the Contract Documents; and (d) execute and complete all
Work included in and covered by the City's award of this Contract to the Contractor, such award
being based on the acceptance by the City of the Contractor's Proposal, or part thereof, as
follows:

Agreement to full proposal

The contract is contingent on being able to set up two on-line stores. One on-line
store for non-taxable clothing allowance items and one for taxable purchases;
those above and beyond the clothing allowance provided for each individual.

2. The City agrees to pay to the Contractor for the performance of the Work embraced in this
Contract, the Contractor agrees to accept as full compensation therefore, the following sums and
prices for all Work covered by and included in the Contract award and designated above, payment
thereof to be made in the manner provided by the City:

The City will pay for products/service, according to the Line ltem pricing as listed
in Contractors Proposal/Supplier Response, a copy thereof being attached to and
made a part of this Contract. Fire Personnel shall order on an as needed basis for
the duration of the contract. The total cost of products or services for the City
shall not exceed $90,000.00 during the contract term without approval.

3. Equal Employment Opportunity. In connection with the carrying out of this project, the contractor
shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of race, color,
religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, disability, age or marital status. The Contractor will take
affirmative action to ensure that applicants are employed, and that employees are treated during
employment, without regard to their race, color, religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, disability,
age or marital status. Such action shall include, but not be limited to, the following: employment,
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upgrading, demotion or transfer; recruitment or recruitment advertising; layoff or termination; rates
of pay or other compensation; and selection for training, including apprenticeship.

4, E-Verify. In accordance with Neb. Rev. Stat. 4-108 through 4-114, the contractor agrees to
register with and use a federal immigration verification system, to determine the work eligibility
status of new employees performing services within the state of Nebraska. A federal immigration
verification system means the electronic verification of the work authorization program of the
Hlegal Immigration Reform and immigrant Responsibility Act of 1996, 8 U.S.C. 1324 a, otherwise
known as the E-Verify Program, or an equivalent federal program designated by the United States
Department of Homeland Security or other federal agency authorized to verify the work eligibility
status of a newly hired employee pursuant to the Immigration Reform and Control Act of 1986.
The Contractor shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment to be
employed in the performance of this section pursuant to the requirements of state law and 8

U.S.C.A 1324b. The contractor shall require any subcontractor to comply with the provisions of
this section.

5, Termination. This Contract may be terminated by the following:
5.1)  Termination for Convenience. Either party may terminate this Contract upon thirty (30)
days written notice to the other party for any reason without penalty.
5.2) Termination for Cause. The City may terminate the Contract for cause if the Contractor:

5.2.1) Refuses or fails to supply the proper labor, materials and equipment necessary {o
provide services and/or commodities.

5.2.2) Disregards Federal, State or local laws, ordinances, regulations, resolutions or
orders.

5.2.3) Otherwise commits a substantial breach or default of any provision of the
Contract Document. In the event of a substantial breach or default the City will
provide the Contractor written notice of said breach or default and aliow the
Contractor ten (10) days from the date of the written notice to cure such breach or
default. If said breach or default is not cured within ten (10) days from the date of
notice, then the contract shall terminate.

8. Independent Contractor. 1t is the express intent of the parties that this contract shall not create an
employer-employee relationship. Employees of the Contractor shall not be deemed to be
employees of the City and employees of the City shall not be deemed to be employees of the
Contractor. The Contractor and the City shall be responsible to their respective employees for all
salary and benefits. Neither the Contractor's employees nor the City’s employees shall be entitled
to any salary, wages, or benefits from the other party, including but not limited to overtime,
vacation, retirement benefits, workers' compensation, sick leave or injury leave. Contractor shall
also be responsible for maintaining workers’ compensation insurance, unemployment insurance
for its employees, and for payment of all federal, state, local and any other payroll taxes with
respect to its employees’ compensation.

7. Contract Term. This Contract shall be effective upon execution by both parties. The term of the
Contract shall be a one (1) year term, with option to renew for three (3) additional one (1) year
terms.

8. The Contract Documents comprise the Contract, and consist of the following:
Contract Agreement

Accepted Proposal/Supplier Response
Addendum No. 1

Special Provisions

Specifications

Maltese Cross Logo Photo

Chief's White T-Shirt Sample

Back of Fire Fighter Shirt Sample

. Chief's Polo Sample

10. Instructions to Bidders

11. Insurance Requirements

12. Sales Tax Exemption Form 13

CoOENOG AW -

These Contract Agreements, together with the other Contract Documents herein above
mentioned, form this Contract, and they are as fully a part of the Contract as if hereto attached or herein
repeated.
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The Contractor and the City hereby agree that all the terms and conditions of this Contract shall
be binding upon themselves, and their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal

representatives, successors, and assigns.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Contractor and the City do hereby execute this contract.

EXECUTION BY THE CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA

A/?E&‘T:

€ty Clerk

CITY QF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA
\ TN

o

s,

Chris Beutler, Mayor 1

G872

Ui

[e
ot

Approved by Executive No.

Dated __° \X‘i\iﬁﬁ' LgchéL%

EXECUTION BY CONTRACTOR

IF A CORPORATION:

ATTEST:
(SEAL)

Secretary

IF OTHER TYPE OF ORGANIZATION:

IF AN INDIVIDUAL:

Mgl mic‘?wwfiv S Cad Iﬂ@

Name of Corporation

IS0 E. M s}r‘c”n’&«i i“‘\/ﬁ LMWT

(Address

By: Ap ==
Duly Authorlzed Ofﬁcnal T

X
Deradens Yl naged

Legal Title of Official

Name of Organization

Type of Organization

(Address)
By:
Member

By:
Member

Name

Address

Signature
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)

Bid information

Supplier Response

Contact Information

Ship to Information

Bid Creator

Email
Phone
Fax

Bid Number
Title

Bid Type
Issue Date
Close Date
Need by Date

Sharon R. Mulder Asst
Purchasing Agent
smulder@lincoln.ne.gov
(402) 441-7428

(402) 4416513

14-102 Addendum 1

Lincoln Fire & Rescue
Department Uniforms with a
Web-Based Ordering System
- Rebid

Bid

04/04/2014

4/18/2014 12:00:00 PM CT

Suppiier Information

Address Purchasing
440 8. 8th St.
Lincoin, NE 68508
Contact Sharon R. Mulder Asst
Purchasing Agent
Department
Building
Suite 200
Floor/Room
Telephone (402) 441-7428
Fax (402) 441-6513
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov

Address

Contact

Department
Building

Fioor/Room
Telephone

Fax

Email

Company
Address

Contact
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone
Fax

Email
Submitted
Total

Signature

MES - Mid America
1880 East Military Ave.

Fremont, NE 68025

1(402) 727-5785
1 (402) 727-5789

4/18/2014 10:06:59 AMCT
$1,720.00

Supplier Notes

Bid Notes

Bid Activities

Bid Messages

Please review the following and respond where necessary
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10

11

12

13

14

15

Narf}g

) Note

insiructions to Bidders

Bid Documents

Sample Contract

Specifications

Contact
Renewal is an Option

Special Provision Term Contract Provisions

Term Clause of Contract

References

Samples

ch

Documentation

Tax Exempt Certification Forms

Electronic Signature

Agreement to Addendum No. 1

I acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions
{o Bidders.

I acknowledge and accept that it is my responsibility as a

Bidder to promptly notify the Purchasing Depariment Staff
prior o the close of the bid of any ambiguity, inconsistency
or error which | may discover upon examination of the bid
documents including, but not fimited to the Specifications.

I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample
contract.

| acknowledge reading and understanding the
specifications.

Name of person submitting this bid:
Contract Extenstion Renewal is an option.

I acknowledge reading and understanding the Special
Provision Term Contract Provisions.

1 acknowledge that the term of the contract is for a one (1)
year term with the option for three (3) additional one (1)
year renewals from the date of the executed contract.
<BR>(a) Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year
contract period. YES or NO<BR>

{b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation/de-escalation
YES or NO<BR>

{c) If (b), state period for which prices will remain firm:
through

| have attached my References to the Response
Attachment section of this bid.

! have sent the samples as reqtiested per Section 14 of
the specifications.

I have sent a CD per specification 12.1.2, outlining
ordering procedures o same address as listed in Section
12,

I acknowledge that | have attached our web-based
ordering system process documentation

Materials being purchased in this bid are tax exempt and
unit prices are reflected as such. A Purchasing Agent
Appointment form and a Exempt Sales Certificate form
shall be issued with contract documents. (Note: State Tax
Law does not provide for sales tax exemption for
proprietary functions for government, thereby excluding
the purchases of pipes to be installed in water lines and
purchase of water meters.)

Please check here for your electronic signature,

Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth in

this addendum has been incorporated in their proposat and

is part of their bid. <br>Reason: See Bid Attachments
section for Addendum information.
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Yes

Yes

Yes

Brian L. Nielsen
Yes

Yes

Yes, Yes, 12 Months

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes



Line items

#  Qty UOM  Description - - Response
1 1 EA Team Sweat Pants $30.00
Manufacturer: Under Armour or equivalent Manufacturer #: Fleece Storm Pants
item Notes: <br>Men (1232731} and Women (1239181) sizes<br>Color: Black<br>Water resistant fleece warm-up
pants<br>Charged cotton storm fleece pants with pockets
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: 'Flépé's‘e review t/hé‘fd'l‘ldﬁiﬁg and respond where rfécessary ) o o
# _ Name ... Note . I Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Modetl of the item Mens Gildan 18400, Womens
you are bidding. Gildan 18400FL
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid fine Over 2XL $32.50
price.
2 1 EA Crew Neck Sweatshirts
Manufacturer: Gildan or equivalent Manufacturer #: G120
item Notes: <br>Color. Navy, Irish Green<br>Weight 9.3 oz<br>50/50 Cotton/Poly with pill resistant air jetspun yarn<br>1 x 1
Lycra Spandex ribbed cuffs and waistband<br>Fully covered seam<br>Sweatshirts include a silkscreen Maltese
Cross logo in one color on left chest<br>Back shall have in White lettering in Arched Caps Varsity LINCOLN
(1.75") next line shall be FIRE RESCUE (1,25
Supplier Notes:
item Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary o
#  Name . _ Note - Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item Gildan G120
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 2XL-3XL $35.29
price. Shirts only.
3 Silkscreen Logo Please provide the price of the silkscreen Maltese Cross  S-XL $28.00, 2XL-3XL $37.50
. logo to be placed on left chest. The silkscreen shall be a
one (1) color, white. The price you put here shall include
the t-shirt and the logo together as one for all sizes.
3 1 EA Logistics Crew Neck Sweatshirts $20.00

Manufacturer: Jerzees or equivalent Manufacturer # 996DX

ltem Notes: <br>Color: Safari Brown<br>Weight 8.0 oz<br>50/50 Cotton/NuBlend pill resistant fleece<br>Pricing shall include
standard Lincoln Fire logo embroidered logo on left chest<br>Four colors: White, Black, Red and Gold

Supplier Notes:
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ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessa . -
# Name Note ; _ Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item Gildan G180 Chocolate
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 2XL-5XL $25.00
price, Pricing shall include the embroidery that is pictured
in the attachment above.

1 EA Logistics Hooded Pullover Sweatshirts $25.00
Manufacturer: Jerzees or equivalent Manufacturer #: 996DX
item Notes: <br>Color: Safari Brown<br>Weight 8.0 0z<br>50/50 Cotton/NuBlend pill resistant fleece<br>1 x 1 ribbed cuffs
and waistband<br>2-ply hood with grommets<br>Front pocket pouch<br>Pricing shall include standard Lincoln Fire
logo embroidered logo on left chest<br>
Four colors: White, Black, Red and Gold

Supplier Notes:

g}em Altributes: Please review the foliowing and respondﬂwhere necessary .
#__ Name Note ) Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Piease provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item Gildan G185 Chocolate
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid fine 2XL-8X1L. $32.70
price. Pricing shall include the embroidery that is pictured
in the attachment above.

1 EA Uniform Shorts, Tactile Pro Short 11" $34.00

Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #: 73308

tem Notes: <br>Mens<br>Weight: 6.14 oz.<br>65% polyester/35% cotton ripstop<br>Color: Black and Khaki<br>11"
inseam<br>S8ignature rear strap and slash pocket design<br>Action waist for comfort and fit.<br>Teflon treated for

spill and stain resistance<br>Fade and wrinkle-free

Supplier Notes:

ltem Attributes: Please revievguthé following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note _ Response B
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item 5.11 #73308

you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line nla

price.
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1 EA Uniform Shorts, Tactile Pro Short 8* $34.00

Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #: 63071

ltem Notes: <br>Womens<br>Weight: 6.14 0z.<br>65% polyester/35% cotton ripstop<br>Color: Black and Khaki<br>9"
inseam<br>Signature rear strap and slash pocket design<br>Action waist for comfort and fit.<br>Tefion treated for

spill and stain resistance<br>Fade and wrinkie-free

Supplier Notes:

f@ﬁ%w}\«fiﬁbuiéé?M{’T@ése review the following and respond where necessary "

#__ Name _Note _Response i
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #63071
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line nia
price.
1 EA Uniform Pants, Tactlite Pro Pants, Rip Stop Cargo $35.00

Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactlite or equivalent

item Notes: <br>Men (74273) and Women (84360) sizes<br>Weight: 6.14 0z.<br>65% polyester/35% cotton ripstop<br>Cotor:
Black<br>Magazine/Cell phone pocket<br>Two cargo pockets<br>Patented slash rear pockets<br>HT Tefion
wear resistant finish<br>External knife pocket<br>Rear web strap<br>Clip loop

Supplier Notes:

item Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary N o
# Name R Note i Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #74273 & #64360
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line #74273 $41.00, #64360 n/a
price.
1 EA Uniform Pants, Poly/Cotton Twill Trouser , $34.00

Manufacturer: Flying Cross or equivalent Manufacturer # 49410

ltem Notes: <br>Mens<br>Weight: 6.5 oz.<br> Quarter top pockets<br>Color: Black<br>Freedom fit |l waistband with 2-zone
stretch comfort<br>Lintrak creases<br>Moisture management with stainsmart<br>3.4" wide belt loops

Supplier Notes:

#_ Name Note __Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item 511 #74370
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 46-80, $37.50
price.
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e] 1 EA Uniform Pants, T-1 Trouser, System 3 Polyester $34.75
Manufacturer: Flying Cross or equivalent Manufacturer #: 3910
ltem Notes: <br>Mens<br>Weight: 12 to 12.5 oz.<br> Quarter top pockets<br>Color: Black<br>Tab on left hip pocket<br>3.4"
wide belt loops
Supplier Notes:
ltemn Attributes: Please review the fouowmg and respond wheré"‘hecessary B -
# _ Name e MOt . Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 #74338
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 46-60, $37.50
price.
10 1 EA Class A Uniform Dress Trousers $34.75
Manufacturer: Flying Cross, Fechheimer or equivalent Manufacturer #: 28P8696
ltem Notes: <br>Mens<br>Quarter top pockets<br>Color: Black<br>Tab on left hip pocket<br>1-1/2" wide belt loops<br>Linfrak
creases<br>55% Poly/45% Wool
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and reébond where necessary o
#  Name B o Note o Response )
1 Manufacturer and Mode! Piease provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #74338
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 46-60, $37.50
price.
11 1 EA Class A Uniform Dress Slacks $34.75

Manufacturer: Flying Cross, Fechheimer or equivalent Manufacturer #: 48005

tem Notes: <br>Womens<br>Quarter top pockets<br>Color: Black<br>Tab on left hip pocket<br>1 112" wide belt
loops<br>Lintrak creases<br>55% Polyf45% Wool

Supplier Notes:

ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 #74338
you are bidding,

2 Pricing Piease provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 46-60, $37.50
price.
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1 EA Dress Blouse Skirt ‘ No Bid
Manufacturer: Flying Cross, Fechheimer or equivalent Manufacturer #: 4800SK

ltem Notes: <br>Womens<br>Quarter top pockets<br>Color: Black<br>Tab on left hip pocket<br>1-1/2" wide belt
loops<br>Lintrak creases<br>55% Poly/45% Wool

Supplier Notes:

‘i{éﬁ;)&ﬁrib\it’ég;hﬁgasé’ review the fol
# __ Name

~Note N Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line
price.

1 EA Uniform Work Pants $34.00
Manufacturer. Dickies or equivalent Manufacturer #: 874
ltem Notes: <br>Mens<br>Color: Black<br>Wrinkle resistant<br>Stain release finish

Supplier Notes:

ltem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary L
#  Name __ Note ____ Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item 511 #74273
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 41.00
price. :
1 EA Uniform Work Flat Front Will Pant $34.00

Manufacturer: Dickies or equivalent Manufacturer #: FP331
item Notes: <br>Womens<br>Color: Black<br>Wrinkle resistani<br>Stain release finish<br>65% Polyester, 35% Cotton

Supplier Notes:

ttem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name ... Note _ Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #74273
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 41.00
price,
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15 1 EA Uniform Badge Shirt, Long Sleeve No Bid
Manufacturer: Flying Cross by Flechheimer or equivalent Manufacturer #; 35W5441
ltem Notes: <br>Men (35W5441) and Women (126R5441) sizes<br>Weight: 4.25 oz. Poly/Cotton Duro Poplin<br>Colors:
Silver Gray<br>Gray shirts must come with coliar eyelets<br>Must come with Lincoln Fire & Rescue shoulder
patches, one sewn on each sleeve (price shall include this)<br>Pleated pockets and scalloped pocket flaps with
Velcro closure<br>Sewn in creases, 2-front, continuing through the pocket and pocket flap and 3 in back<br>
Pleated pockets with scalloped flaps<br>Full Badge sling<br>Conventional coliar and band with permanent collar
stays<br>Customizable with emblems, embroidery or heat press
Supplier Notes:
llem Aftibules: Please review the following and réspond where necessary
#__ Name e Note Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line’
price.
3 Optional Concealed Zipper Please provide the price of the option for the concealed
zipper that may be added on placket front,
16 1 EA Uniform Badge Shirt, Short Sleeve No Bid

Manufacturer: Flying Cross by Flechheimer or equivalent

ltem Notes: <br>Men (85R5441) and Women (176R5441) sizes<br>Weight: 4.25 oz. Poly/Cotton Duro Poplin<br>
Colors: Silver Gray<br>
Gray shirts must come with collar eyelets<br>Must come with Lincoln Fire & Rescue shoulder patches, one sewn
on each sleeve (price shall include this)<br>
Pleated pockets and scalloped pocket flaps with Velcro closure<br>Sewn in creases, 2-front, continuing through
the pocket and pocket flap and 3 in back<br>Pleated pockets with scalloped flaps<br>Full Badge sling
Conventional collar and band with permanent collar stays<br>
Customizable with emblems, embroidery or heat press

Supplier Notes:

ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#_ Neme Note ___Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line
price.
3 Optional Concealed Zipper Please provide the price of the option for the concealed

zipper that may be added on placket front
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17 1 EA Uniform Badge Shir, Long Sleeve $34.75
Manufacturer: Flying Cross by Flechheimer or equivalent Manufacturer #: 35W7886
ltem Notes: <br>Men (35W7886) and Women (127R7886) sizes<br>Weight: 4.25 oz. Poly/Cotton Duro Poplin<br>Colors:
Navy<br>Eyelets to shirts<br>Must come with Lincoln Fire & Rescue Left Sleeve Patches and EMT/FIRE Right
Sleeve Patches (price shall include this)<br>Pleated pockets and scalloped pocket flaps with Velcro
closure<br>7-button placket front<br>Sewn in creases, 2-front, continuing through the pocket and pocket flap and 3
in back<br>Full Badge sling<br>Conventional collar and band with permanent collar stays<br>Customizable with
emblems, embroidery or heat press
Supplier Notes:
Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary R
#__Neme = . Note e _Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 #72365
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 3XL-6XL $37.50
price.
3 Optional Concealed Zipper Please provide the price of the option for the concealed n/a
. zipper that may be added on placket front.
18 1 EA Uniform Badge Shirl, Short Sleeve $34.75

Manufacturer: Flying Cross by Flechheimer or equivalent

ltem Notes: <br>Men (85R7886) and Women (177R7886) sizes<br>Weight: 4.25 oz. Poly/Cotton Duro Poplin<br>Colors:
Navy<br>Eyelets to Shirts<br>Must come with Lincoln Fire & Rescue Left Sleeve Patches and EMT/FIRE Right
Sleeve Patches (price shall include this)<br>Pleated pockets and scalloped pocket flaps with Velcro
closure<br>7-button placket front<br>Sewn in creases, 2-front, continuing through the pocket and pocket flap and 3
in back<br>Full Badge sling<br>Conventional collar and band with permanent collar stays<br>Customizable with
emblems, embroidery or heat press

Supplier Notes:

m Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary e -
Name .. Note Response

i Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 #71167
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 3XL-6XL $37.50
price.
3 Optional Concealed Zipper Please provide the price of the option for the concealed n/a

zipper that may be added on placket front.
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19 1 EA Uniform TexTrop Dress Shirt, Short Sleeve $34.75
Manufacturer: Elbeco or equivalent
ltem Notes: <br>Men {3310) and Women (9811LC & 9810LC) sizes<br>Weight: 5.5 0z. <br>Stretch 100% textured polyester,
tropical weave<br>Colors: White and Silver Gray<br>Eyelets to shirts<br>Must come with Lincoln Fire & Rescue
Left Sleeve Patches and EMT/FIRE Right Sleeve Patches (price shall include this)<br>Two pleated pockets with
scalloped pocket flaps with scalloped<br>Fully lined front placket<br>Badge eyelets with internal support
strap<br>Top fused convertible collar<br>Two button tab cuffs with dress placket for roll-up functionality
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary - -
#__ Name . Note .. Response .
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufaciurer and Modetl of the item 511 #71183
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 3XL-6XL. $37.50
price.
3 Optional Concealed Zipper Please provide the price of the option for the concealed nfa
zipper thal may be added on placket front,
20 1 EA Performance Short Sleeve Polo Shirt $28.50
Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent
item Notes: Men (71049) and Womens (61165) <br>Color: White<br>100% Polyester<br>Three button placket<br>Weight:
6.7 oz<br>No snag polyester fabric<br>No roll collar with flexible collar stays <br>Accepts embroidery and silk
screening
Supplier Notes:
jtem Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary - -
# _ Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer and Mode! Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #71049 & #61165
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid fine 325
price,
21 1 EA Performance Long Sleeve Polo Shirt $30.00

Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent
item Notes: Men (72049)<br>Color: White
100% Polyester<br>Three button placket<br>Weight: 6.7 oz<br>
No snag polyester fabric<br>
No roli collar with flexible collar stays<br>Accepts embroidery and silk screening

Supplier Notes:
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item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#__ Name Note _ Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #72049
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide [Sricing for sizes not included in bid line 33.00
price,
22 1 EA Uniform Paragon Dress Shirt, Short Sleeve $34.75
Manufacturer: Elbeco or equivalent
ftem Notes: <br=Men (P867) and Women (P811) sizes<br>Weight: 4.25 oz. - 7.25 <br>Colors: White<br>Two pleated
pockets with scalloped pocket flaps <br>Fully lined front placket<br>Badge eyelets with internal support
strap<br>Top fused banded dress collar<br>Two button tab cuffs with dress placket for rofl-up
functionality<br>Nano fluid repellency technology<br>UV40+ sun protection<br>LFR patch to be sewn on left
sleeve
Supplier Notes:
ftem Attributes: Please review the following and respond \}Gﬁére necessary N o o - )
#  Name ~ Note e Response_{ ~
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 #71183
you are bidding.
2 Pricing . Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 3XL-6XL $37.50
price.
3 Optional Concealed Zipper Please provide the price of the option for the concealed nfa
zipper thai may be added on placket front.
23 1 EA Uniform Paragon Dress Shirt, Long Sleeve $34.75

Manufacturer: Elbeco or equivalent

tem Notes: <br>Men (P877) and Women (P801) sizes<br>Weight: 4.25 oz. - 7.25 <br>Colors: White<br>Two pleated
pockets with scalloped pocket flaps <br>Fully lined front placket<br=Badge eyelets with internal support
strap<br>Top fused banded dress collar<br>Two button tab cuffs with dress placket for roli-up
functionality<br>Nano fluid repellency technology<br>UV40+ sun protection<br>LFR patch to be sewn on left

sleeve

Supplier Notes:

Item Atfributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note o N Response B
1 Manufaciurer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item 511 #72344
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 37.50
price.
3 Optional Concealed Zipper Please provide the price of the option for the concealed n/a

zipper that may be added on placket front.
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24 1 EA Leather Trouser Belt $27.00
Manufacturer. 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #: 59503
ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>Basketweave finish<br>1-1/5" Wide<br>Reinforced Stitching
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary - )
#_ Name . ___ Note _ Response R
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item 5.11 #59503
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 31
price.
25 1 EA - TDU Belt $12.00
Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #: 50552
ltern Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>1-7/5" Wide<br>Triple stitched reinforcements<br>Strengthened nylon webbing<br>Fade and
rip resistant
Supplier Notes:
} Note . ] ~ Response
1 Manufacturer and Mode! Please provide the Manufacturer and Modet of the item 5.11 #59552
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 45
price.
26 1 EA 3.5" Four in Hand Self Tie with Buttonholes $7.50
Manufacturer #: 90099-00
ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>3.5" x 61" long mens necktie
Supplier Notes:
ltem Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary -
#_  Name .. Note ) _ Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the manufacturer and model of the item Samuel Broome #90099-00
you are bidding.
27 1 EA 3.5" Clip-on Tie with Buttonholes $7.50

Manufacturer #: 90016-00
ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>3.5" x 14.5" long womens necktie

Supplier Notes:
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ltem Aﬂripu‘tgs;f’jéése review the following and respond where necessary

# Neme Note Bésponse

1 Manufacturer and Model Piease provide the manufacturer and model of the item Samuel Broome #80018-00
you are bidding.

28 1 EA Uniform Company Boot, Men's $82.00
Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent Manufacturer #: 12032
ltem Notés: <br>Color: Black<br>Leather polished leather outer<br>Composite shank<br>Moisture wicking, anti-bacterial
lining<br>0il and slip resistant<br>Toe and heel fence climbing lugs
Supplier Notes:
ftem Aftributes: Please ré?iéi;v the foliowing and respond where necessary B T
#__ Name Note o Response )
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #12032
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
29 1 EA Uniform Shoe, A.T.A.C. 6" Tactile Boot $63.00
Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent Manufacturer #: 12002 Mens
ltemn Notes: <br>Men and Women (Style sizes for Womens is 12008)<br>Color: Black<br>polished leather toe<br>Full grain
leather and nylon upper<br>Antibacterial and moisture wicking lining<br>Shock Mitigation System<br>Oil and slip
resistant, quite outsole<br>Cushioning insole foam<br>Open cell foam cushioning <br>Dual density polyou
cushioning<br>Hypertext lasting board<br>Non-metallic shank<br>Injection molded phylon midsole<br>Semi-ridge
heel and toe reinforcement<br>Availability in wide widths
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary V’ e
#__ Name .. Note Response
1 Manufacturer and Model! Please provide the Manufaciurer and Model of the item 5.11 #12002 & #12008
you are bidding.
2 Pricing : Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
30 1 EA Uniform Shoe, AT.A.C. 8" Tactile Boot with Side Zip $63.00

Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent

ltem Notes: <br>Men (12018) and Women (12025) (Style sizes for Womens is 12008)<br>Polished leather toe<br>Eull grain
leather and nylon <br>Antibacterial and moisture wicking lining<br>Shock Mitigation System<br>0Oil and slip
resistant, quite outsole<br>Cushioning inscle foam<br>Stay tied sausage laces<br>Hypertext lasting
board<br>Non-metallic shank<br>Injection molded phylon midsole<br>Semi-ridge heel and toe
reinforcement<br>YKK zipper hardware

Supplier Notes:
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Item Atributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# Name e Note . Response i
1 Manufacturer and Model : Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #12018 and #12025
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
31 1 EA Uniform Shoe, A.T.A.C. 8" Tactite Boot with Side Zip $66.00
Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent
liem Notes: <br>Men (12001) and Women (12007) (Style sizes for Womens is 12008)<br>Color: Black<br>Polished leather
toe<br>Fuil grain leather and nylon <br>Antibacterial and moisture wicking lining<br>Shock Mitigation
System<br>Oil and slip resistant, quite outsole<br>Cushioning insole foam<br>Stay tied sausage
laces<br>Hypertext lasting board<br>Non-metallic shank<br>Injection molded phylon midsole<br>Semi-ridge heel
and toe reinforcement<br>YKK zipper hardware
Supplier Notes:
liem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary T
#  Name __ Note S Response
1 Manufacturer and Mode! Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #12001 & #12007
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line nla
price.
32 1 EA Uniform Shoe, High Shine Patrol Oxford $67.00
Manufacturer. Bates or equivalent Manufacturer #: 22233
tem Notes: <br>High shine leather upper<br>Color: Black<br>Slip resistant rubber outsole cement
construction<br>Breathable mesh lining
Supplier Notes:
item Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary o
#  Name Note } _ Response
1 Manufacturer and Mode! Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item Bates #22233
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
33 1 EA Uniform Shoe, High Gloss Oxford No Bid

Manufacturer: Magnum or equivalent Manufacturer #: 5098

ftem Notes:  <br>Mens<br>Color: Black<br>High gloss polyurethane coated leather upper<br>Leather lined<br>Slip and oil
resistant carbon rubber outsole<br>Color: Black

Supplier Notes:
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héﬁﬁ\ﬁr@?éﬁgéfEl‘eérs'é”ré\'/iéw the féﬁﬁvﬁﬁg and respond where neéégwswaﬁw
# Nam

Note __ Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Piease provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line
price.
1 EA Athletic Oxford Duty Shoe $96.00

Manufacturer: Rocky or equivalent

ftem Notes: <br>Mens (911-110-1)<br>Color: Black<br>Rubber Siped 911 Slipstop out sole<br>Leather lined<br>Slip and oil
resistant carbon rubber outsole<br>Color: Black

Supplier Notes:

[{gmwAttﬁbuteS: Please review the following and respond where necessary

# MName Note o . Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item ROCKY BOOT (911-110-1)
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
1 EA Street Sliip Resistant Athletic Oxford Shoe $63.50

Manufacturer: Reebok or equivalent

item Notes: <br>Mens (RB1100) Womens (RB110) <br>Color: Black<br>Soft toe<br>Leather upper<br>Removable EVA
Cushion Insert with Underside Heel Pad<br>Lining: Taibrelle

Supplier Notes:

ltem Attributeg:wﬁeasg review the fo!!dwing and respond where necessary

#_ Name o o Nete Response .
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #12142
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
1 EA Slipstop Slip-On Duty Shoe $56.50

Manufacturer; Rocky or equivalent Manufacturer #: 911-104-2

item Notes: <br>Mens<br>Color: Black<br>Full grain leather<br>Non-metallic<br>Padded mesh collar and
tongue<br>Polyurethane insent

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#__Name ~Note o B Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item ROCKY BOOT (811-104-2)
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid fine n/a
price.
37 1 EA Slip Stop Athletic Toe Oxford Shoe $63.50
Manufacturer: Rocky or equivalent Manufacturer #: 911-210-2
ltem Notes: <br>Womens<br>Color: Black<br>Full grain leather<br>Lightweight<br>Moisture wicking lining<br.Qil and slip
resistant rubber siped slipstop outsole ‘
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes; Please review the following and respond where necessary - i i
#__Neme ., Note . ... Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 #12142
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price,
38 1 EA Mens Company CST 2 Boot $80.00
Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent Manufacturer #: 12033
itemn Notes: <br>Mens<br>Color: Black<br>Full grain water resistant leather<br>Lightweight<br>Moisture wicking fining<br>0il
and slip resistant<br>Kick plate plugs at the heel<br>Ortholite sock liners
Supplier Notes:
i}éym Altributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary . V_ R
#__ Name ... Note __ Response )
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 #12033
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
39 1 EA Uniform Baseball Hat $12.00

Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #: 89260-724

item Notes: <br>Color: Navy<br>Sizes: Self-adjusting elastic; one size fits ali<br>Teflon finish<br>Fade
resistant<br>Poly-Cotton Twill<br>Accepts embroidery and silk screening<br>White 3/4" block lettering on front
spelling out "Lincoln Fire & Rescue"<br>Proofs are required before any production run.<br>Lettering to be
determined if upper case only or both upper and lower case.

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#__Neme

. Note . . Response

1 Manufacturer and Model! ' Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #89620-724
you are bidding. i

2 Pricing Pricing for silk screening and embroidery <b>shall be n/a
included in bid price.<b><br>is the price different?<br>|f
so, please let the price for silk screening in the line item
and put the price embroidery here.

40 1 EA Beanie Hat Cap $14.25
Manufacturer: Yupoong equivalent Manufacturer #: 1500
item Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>100% Turbo spun acrylic knit<br>The 1500 is 8.5 inches in length<br>Allow for
embroidery<br>To be embroidered in 1" white block letters the following: LER
Supplier Notes:
Item Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary ] -
#__ Name . Note - Response -
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #89250
you are bidding.
41 1 EA Cuffed Beanie Hat Cap $14.25
Manufacturer: Yupoong equivalent Manufacturer #: 1501
ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>100% Turbo spun acrylic knit<br>The 1501 is 12 inches in length<br>Allow for
embroidery<br>To be embroidered in 1" white block letters the following: LFR
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the fonowipg ‘and respond whéféfiécessary ) o
#  Name ) Note _ Response ) -
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #89250
you are bidding.
42 1 EA T-Shirts, Station Wear Short Sleeve $16.50

Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #: 40050

item Notes: <br>Color: Navy, White<br>6 oz Jersey Knit<br>Durable, comfortable, and functional<br>Extra long to stay tucked
in<br>One inch, no roll, high density collar<br>Double needle tailoring at the shoulder<br>4.5 oz ring spun
cotton<br>Moisture wicking technology<br>Printed label to prevent chafing<br>Spandex ribbed crew
neck<br>Accepts embroidery and silk screening<br>Must come screened with Lincoln Fire & Rescue logo over left
breast and department name on back.

Supplier Notes:

itern Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary o
#  Name ~ Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #40050
you are bidding.
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2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 19.50

price.
43 1 EA T-Shirts, Station Wear Long Sleeve $16.00
Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #: 40052
ltem Notes: <br>Color: Navy<br>6 oz Jersey Knit<br>Durable, comfortable, and functional<br>Extra long to stay tucked
in<br>One inch, no roll, high density collar<br>Double needle talloring at the shoulder<br>4.5 oz ring spun
cotton<br>Moisture wicking technology<br>Printed labe! to prevent chafing<br>Spandex ribbed crew
neck<br>Accepts embroidery and silk screening<br>Must come screened with Lincoln Fire & Rescue logo over left
breast and department name on back.
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respona;‘iryhere necessary ]
# Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item 5.11 #40052
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 18.00
price.
44 1 Pkg Utilit-T, 3-pack Cotton Short Sieeve Shirt $30.00
Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivaient Manufacturer #: 40016-0109 (White) - 40050-720 (Navy)
ltem Notes: <br>Color: White, Navy<br>100% ringspun 4.5 oz cotton<br>Cut extra long with a tapered fit<br>Moisture
wicking<br>No tag, heat printed
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary -
#_ Name _ Note e ~ Response i
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #4016-0109 & #40050-720
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line 33.00
price.
45 1 PKG Black 68" Crew Socks $17.50

Manufacturer: 5.11 or equivalent Manufacturer #. 50078-019
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

lter Attributes. Please review the following and respond where necessary

#__ Name Note o Response ]
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #50078-109
you are bidding.
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46 1 PKG Black HeatGear Lo-Cut Sock $9.00
Manufacturer: Under Armour or equivalent Manufacturer #: UA3312
item Notes: <br>Four (4) Pack<br>Moisture wicking technology
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the @ﬁd@\}iﬁg and respond where necessary T ) ) ‘ )
# _ Neme . Note . Response B}
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #10010
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line nfa
price,
47 1 EA Black Performance Low Cut Sock $9.00
Manufacturer: Profeet or equivalent Manufacturer #: 283L/3
ltem Notes: <br>77% Polyproplene, 12% Stretch Nylon, 8% Elastic, and 3% Spandex
Supplier Notes:
ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary ) o
# Name ___Note ) Response e
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #10010
you are bidding.
2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line n/a
price.
48 1 EA Tactical Tac-AK2 Glove $34.00

Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent Manufacturer #: 59341-018

ltem Notes: <br>Color. Black<br>Keviar fabric flash and slash protection<br>Reinforced knuckles and finger
joints<br>Goatskin leather and Knit Keviar fabric<br>Adjustable hook and loop closure with leather tab

Supplier Notes:

ftem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name Note

Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item
you are bidding.

2 Pricing Please provide pricing for sizes not included in bid line
price.

5.11 #59341-019

n/a
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49 1 EA Tactical Taclite 2 Glove $24.50
Manufacturer. 5.11 Tactical or equivalent Manufacturer #: 59343-019
ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>Seamless sheepskin paim and construction<br>Four-way stretch back
panei<br>Breathoprene and hook and loop brand closure
Supplier Notes:
't_emA‘E”E‘i’es ease review the following and respond where necessary o i} ." )
#  Name Note Response
1 Manufacturer and Mode! - Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 # 59343.018
you are bidding.
50 1 EA Tactical Tac-A2 Glove $20.75
Manufacturer: 5.11 Tactical or equivalent Manufacturer #: 59340-019
ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>Breathable Nylon<br>Neoprene hook and loop closure<br>Reinforced saddle between
thumb and index finger and pull tab<br>Synthetic leather grip pads
Supplier Notes:
item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary - )
# __ Name Note _ Response
1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 # 59340-018
you are bidding.
51 1 EA Arctic Patrol Glove No Bid
Manufacturer: Hatch equivalent Manufacturer #: APG30
tem Notes: <br>Color: Biack<br>Breathable water proof liner with polyester microfiber insulation and 100% polyester
shell<br>Rubberized Sure Grip paim with trigger control index finger
Supplier Notes:
Item Atiributes: Pleass review the following and respond where necessary _ -
# __ Name S Note - Response } g
1 Manufacturer and Mode! Please provide the Manufacturer and Mode! of the item
you are bidding.
52 1 EA Resister Glove $20.75

Manufacturer: Hatch equivalent Manufacturer # RFK300
item Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>Goatskin feather<br>Wrist-length cuff<br>100% Keviar knit liners

Supplier Notes:

Htem Atiributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary

#  Name / Note - _ Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 511 # 59340-019
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you are bidding.

1 EA Winter Specialist Glove $34.50

Manufacturer: Hatch equivalent Manufacturer #: NS430L

ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>Dual inner lining of 3M Thinsulate insulation and breathable, waterproof<br>Palm synthetic
leather provides grip and accurate feel<br>Hook and loop closure provides a snug fit<br>Extreme-Grip sewn onio

the palm and fingertips

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review}@g_@lowing and respond where necessary

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #59344
you are bidding.
1 EA Specialist Ali-Weather Glove $31.50

Manufacturer: Hatch equivalent Manufacturer #: NS430

item Notes; <br>Color: Black<br>Constructed of neoprene<br>Palm synthetic leather provides grip and accurate
feei<br>Hook and loop closure

Supplier Notes:

ilem Aftributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
#  Name T Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #59359
you are bidding.

1 EA Winter Leather Patrol Glove : $34.50
Manufacturer: Hatch equivalent Manufacturer #: NS430L

ltem Notes: <br>Color: Black<br>Made with soft goatskin leather<br>Leather cinch strap<br>C70 Thinsulate insulation with 2
soft brushed tricot inner liner<br>Digitized print in the palm

Supplier Notes:

ltem Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary i

1 Manufacturer and Model! Please provide the Manufacturer and Model of the item 5.11 #59344
you are bidding.

Response Total: $1,720.00
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