CONTRACT DOCUMENTS

CITYOFLINCOLN
NEBRASKA

ANNUAL SUPPLY
OF
HERSEY WATER METER PARTS
BID NO. 14-221

Mueller Systems
PO Box 128
Cleveland, NC 27013
704.278.2221




CITY OF LINCOLN
CONTRACT TERMS

THIS CONTRACT, made and entered into by and between Mueller Systems, PO Box 128,
Cleveland, NC 27013, hereinafter called “Contractor”, and the City of Lincoln, Nebraska, a municipal
corporation, hereinafter called “City”.

WHEREAS, the City has caused to be prepared, in accordance with law, Specifications, Plans,
and other Contract Documents for the Work herein described, and has approved and adopted said
documents and has caused to be published an advertisement for and in connection with said Work, to-wit:

Annual Supply of Hersey Water Meter Parts, Bid No. 14-221

and,

WHEREAS, the Contractor, in response to such advertisement, has submitted to the City, in the
manner and at the time specified, a sealed Proposal/Supplier Response in accordance with the terms of
said advertisement; and,

WHEREAS, the City, in the manner prescribed by law has publicly opened, read aloud, examined,
and canvassed the Proposals/Supplier Responses submitted in response to such advertisement, and as a
result of such canvass has determined and declared the Contractor to be the lowest responsible bidder for
the said Work for the sum or sums named in the Contractor's Proposal/Supplier Responses, a copy
thereof being attached to and made a part of this Contract;

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the sums to be paid to the Contractor and the mutual
covenants herein contained, the Contractor and the City has agreed and hereby agree as follows:

1. The Contractor agrees to (a) furnish all tools, equipment, supplies, superintendence,
transportation, and other accessories, services, and facilities: (b) furnish all materials, supplies,
and equipment specified to be incorporated into and form a permanent part of the complete work:
(c) provide and perform all necessary labor in a substantial and workmanlike manner and in
accordance with the provisions of the Contract Documents; and (d) execute and complete all
Work included in and covered by the City's award of this Contract to the Contractor, such award

being based on the acceptance by the City of the Contractor's Proposal, or part thereof, as
follows:

Agreement to full proposal.

2. The City agrees to pay to the Contractor for the performance of the Work embraced in this
Contract, the Contractor agrees to accept as full compensation therefore, the following sums and

prices for all Work covered by and included in the Contract award and designated above, payment
thereof to be made in the manner provided by the City:

The City will pay for products/service, according to the Line Item pricing as listed
in Contractors Proposal/Supplier Response, a copy thereof being attached to and
made a part of this Contract. The City shall order on an as needed basis for the
duration of the contract. The total cost of products or services for City
departments shall not exceed $14,424.75 during the contract term without
approval.

3. Equal Employment Opportunity. In connection with the carrying out of this project, the contractor
shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of race, color,
religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, disability, age or marital status. The Contractor will take
affirmative action to ensure that applicants are employed, and that employees are treated during
employment, without regard to their race, color, religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, disability,
age or marital status. Such action shall include, but not be limited to, the following: employment,
upgrading, demotion or transfer; recruitment or recruitment advertising; layoff or termination: rates
of pay or other compensation; and selection for training, including apprenticeship.
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E-Verify. In accordance with Neb. Rev. Stat. 4-108 through 4-114, the contractor agrees to
register with and use a federal immigration verification system, to determine the work eligibility
status of new employees performing services within the state of Nebraska. A federal immigration
verification system means the electronic verification of the work authorization program of the
llegal Immigration Reform and Immigrant Responsibility Act of 1996, 8 U.S.C. 1324 a, otherwise
known as the E-Verify Program, or an equivalent federal program designated by the United States
Department of Homeland Security or other federal agency authorized to verify the work eligibility
status of a newly hired employee pursuant to the Immigration Reform and Control Act of 19886.
The Contractor shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment to be
employed in the performance of this section pursuant to the requirements of state law and 8

U.S.C.A 1324b. The contractor shall require any subcontractor to comply with the provisions of
this section.

Termination. This Contract may be terminated by the following:

51) Termination for Convenience. Either party may terminate this Contract upon thirty (30)
days written notice to the other party for any reason without penalty.

5.2) Termination for Cause. The City may terminate the Contract for cause if the Contractor:

5.2.1) Refuses or fails to supply the proper labor, materials and equipment necessary to
provide services and/or commodities.

5.2.2) Disregards Federal, State or local laws, ordinances, regulations, resolutions or
orders. '

5.2.3) Otherwise commits a substantial breach or default of any provision of the
Contract Document. In the event of a substantial breach or default the City will
provide the Contractor written notice of said breach or default and allow the
Contractor ten (10) days from the date of the written notice to cure such breach or
default. If said breach or default is not cured within ten (10) days from the date of
notice, then the contract shall terminate.

Independent Contractor. It is the express intent of the parties that this contract shall not create an
employer-employee relationship. Employees of the Contractor shall not be deemed to be
employees of the City and employees of the City shall not be deemed to be employees of the
Contractor. The Contractor and the City shall be responsible to their respective employees for all
salary and benefits. Neither the Contractor's employees nor the City's employees shall be entitied
to any salary, wages, or benefits from the other party, including but not limited to overtime,
vacation, retirement benefits, workers’ compensation, sick leave or injury leave. Contractor shall
also be responsible for maintaining workers’ compensation insurance, unemployment insurance

for its employees, and for payment of all federal, state, local and any other payroll taxes with
respect to its employees’ compensation.

Period of Performance. This Contract shall be effective upon execution by both parties. The term

of the Contract is for a one (1) year term with the option for three (3) additional one (1) year
renewals from the date of the executed contract.

The Contract Documents comprise the Contract, and consist of the following:
Contract Terms

Accepted Proposal/Supplier Response

Supplier Extra Attachments from E-bid (Price Sheets)

Specifications

Special Provisions

Instructions to Bidders

Notice to Bidders

Nookown~

The herein above mentioned Contract Documents form this Contract and are a part of the

Contract as if hereto attached.

The Contractor and the City hereby agree that all the terms and conditions of this Contract shall

be binding upon themselves, and their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal
representatives, successors, and assigns.
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Contractor and the City do hereby execute this contract, inc/usim of reyisi

EXECUTION BY THE CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA

CILY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA

Public Works & Utilities Pirector

Approved by:
~
Approved by Directorial Orderw_

dated DCA’EW q&? 20 M"

EXECUTION BY CONTRACTOR

IF A CORRORATHON:

L;m#ﬁé L;&L;/:“/“[ Goriy}m)/

ATTEST: x V 7 B’m

S R,
] (SEAL) (Address)

Seeretan ﬁmﬁy Admipistodor Ny G gy

: ¢ Tl
Duly Authorized Official

Prosesal v
Legal Title of Dfficial

Name of Organization

IF OTHER TYPE OF ORGANIZATION:

Type of Organization

(Address)
By:
Member

By:
Member

IF AN INDIVIDUAL :

Name

Address

Signature
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information

Ship to Information

Sharon R. Mulder Asst

Bid Creator Address Purchasing\City & Address Public Works & Utilities

Purchasing Agent County ’ Water System ,
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov 440 S, 8th St. 2021 N. 27th st.
Phone (402) 441-7428 Lincoln, NE 68508 Lincoln, NE 68503
Fax (402) 441-6513 Contact  Sharon Mulder, Asst.  Contact '

Purchasing Agent

Bid Number  14-221 Department
Title Annual Supply of Hersey Department Building

Water Meter Parts Building
Bid Type Bid Floor/Room
Issue Date 08/29/2014 Floor/Room Telephone
Close Date 9/12/2014 12:00:.00 PM CT Telephone (402) 441-7428 Fax
Need by Date Fax (402) 441-6513 Email

Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov

Supplier information

Company Mueller Systems
Address P O Box 128
Cleveland, NC 27013
Contact Anita Short
Department  Marketing
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone 1(704) 278-2221
Fax 1(704) 278-9616
Email ashort@muellersystems.com
Submitted 9/12/12014 9:59:07 AMCT
Total $14,424.75
Signature

Supplier Notes

Tax notincluded.
Hersey Model MCTII has been discontinued; therefore, most of the parts for the MCTIl have been discontinued.

Bid Notes

If you need assistance in preparing your bid, there are several options.

1) Click the the "Help" button in the upper right hand corner of any screen; 2) Contact our office for a training session in
Purchasing or assistance over the phone; 3) View the PowerPoint presentation at
http://www.lincoln.ne.gov/city/finance/purch/spec/veninst.ppt

Bid Activities
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Bid Messages

Please review the following and respond where necessary

# Name Note Response B
1 Instructions o Bidders | acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions Yes

to Bidders.
2 Contact Name of person submitting this bid: Anita Short on behalf of Mueller

3 Sample Contract
contract.

4 Renewal is an Option Contract Extenstion Renewal is an option.

5 Special Provision Term Contract Provisions I acknowledge reading and understanding the Special

Provision Term Contract Provisions.

6 Term Clause of Contract

period. YES or NO

(b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation

YES or NO

(c) f (b), state period for which prices will remain firm:

through

7 Kindred Pricing

8 Delivery State number of delivery days ARO.

FOB to the City/County at the location specified with all

transporation charges paid.

9  Specifications
specifications.

10 Bid Documents

11 Quantities I acknowledge that the quantities listed for each line item
are an estimated yearly amount. The City does not
guarantee any dollar amount or order quantities for the

term of the contract.

12  Bid award I acknowledge and understand that the City, County
and/or Public Building Commission reserves the right to
award bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options,
by groups, or "lump sum” such as shall best serve the
requirements and interests of the City, County and/or

Public Building Commission.

if your pricing is based on an afl-or-nothing basis, please
indicate so in the Supplier Notes section of your E-Bid

response.
13 Not tax exempt

14  Electronic Signature

I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample

I acknowledge that the term of the contract is for a one (1)
year term with the option for three (3) additional one (1)
year renewals from the date of the executed contract. (a)
Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year contract

Kindred pricing for City, i.e., list percent off, catalog
number, or other method approved by City.

I acknowledge reading and understanding the

[ acknowledge and accept that it is my responsibility as a

Bidder to promptly notify the Purchasing Department Staff
prior to the close of the bid of any ambiguity, inconsistency
or error which | may discover upon examination of the bid
documents including, but not limited to the Specifications.

I acknowledge that this project is not tax exempt.

Please check here for your electronic signature.

Systems, LLC

Yes

Yes

Yes

Prices Firm 1 Year; Subsequent
Year(s) May Be Subject To Increase

25% off current Mueller Systems
(Hersey) Parts Price List

Ship 30 Days ARO

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

14-221 - Page 2 of 13



Line ltems

#

1

Gy UOM

Description

Response

30 EA

ltem Notes:

MODEL MVR 50 - Lid Plastic (50377)

Supplier Notes:

$5.25

50 EA

ltem Notes:

Clamp Band (50379) - Model MVR 50

Supplier Notes:

$5.25

25 EA
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes

Seated Registers - Model MVR 50

:MVR 50 Translator Encoder Register with cable connector

$148.50

20 EA

ltem Notes:

Rotor (50571) - Model MVR 50

Supplier Notes:

$48.00

25 EA

item Notes:

Inlet Hub (50568) - Model MVR 50

Supplier Notes:

$19.50

25 EA

item Notes:

Lower Bushing (50574) - Model MVR 50

Supplier Notes:

$5.25

20 EA

ltern Notes:

Liner (60565) - Model MVR 50

Supplier Notes:

$6.75

15 EA

Iltem Notes:

Sapphire Thrust Bearing (Case) (98371) - Model MVR 50

Supplier Notes:

$8.25
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25 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Complete interior (50577) - Model MVR 50

$69.75

10

1 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Bearing Adhesive - Model MVR 50

No Bid

11

10 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

MODEL MCT II, 3" MODEL - Bypass Top Case Gasket (51068P154)

$2.25°

12

10 EA

[tem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Magnet Housing Assembly (Plastic Chamber) (51281G062) - Model MCT Ii, 3" Model $36.75

13

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Chamber Disc (Plastic Interior) (51038G165) - Model MCT 11, 3" Model

$81.00

14

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Bypass Interior Assembly (Plastic) (51258G365) - Model MCT Ii, 3" Model

No Bid

15

5 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Train Cap Gasket (59046) - Model MCT I, 3" Model

$2.25

16

20 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Lower Drive Assembly (Magnetic) (33170) Mode! MCT 1l, 3" Model

$42.00
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17

5 EA

{tem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Spindle Cap Assembly (44750) - Model MCT 1I, 3" Mode!

No Bid

18

2 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Spindle Ball (44726) - Model MCT i, 3" Model

$6.00

19

5 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Spindle/Bushing (Replacement Kit) (44779) - Model MCT 1, 3" Model

No Bid

20

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Spindle Check Nut (44756) - Model MCT 11, 3" Model

$0.75

21

1 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Compiete Assembly (Plastic interior) (44748) - Model MCT I, 3" Model

No Bid

22

1 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Spindle Complete Assembly (44793) - Model MCT 11, 3" Model

$312.75

23

1 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Weight On Mainline of MCTH (54386) - Model MCT I, 3" Model

No Bid

24

4 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Weight and Swing Arm Bushing (54325) - Model MCT 11, 3" Model

No Bid
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25

1 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Weight on Mainline of MCTII (54386) - Model MCT i, 3" Model

No Bid

26

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Rolier and Bushing (54337) - Model MCT I, 3" Model

No Bid

27

10 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Clapper (54365) - Model MCT i, 3" Mode!

No Bid

28

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Complete Assembly (54344) - Model MCT 11, 3" Model

No Bid

29

4 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Hinge Spindle Bushing (54307) (4) - Model MCT i, 3" Model

No Bid

30

2 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Hinge Spindle (54379) (2) - Model MCT 11, 3" Model

No Bid

31

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm (54313) - Model MCT 1, 3" Model

No Bid

32

5 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Roller with Busing (54337) - Model MCT I, 3" Model

No Bid
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33

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Clapper Rubber (Pre-1972) (54316) - Model MCT i, 3" Model

No Bid

34

10 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Clapper Rubber 1972 Design (54366) - Model MCT {l, 3" Model

$15.00

35

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hinge Spindle Bushing (54309) - Model MCT i, 3" Mode!

No Bid

36

1 EA

Iltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hinge Spindle (54379) - Model MCT i, 3" Model

No Bid

37

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

MCT il PARTS, 4" MODEL - Bypass Top Case Gasket (51068P155)

$3.75

38

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Magnet Housing Assembly (Plastic Chamber) (51281G061) - MCT Il Parts, 4" Mode!

$32.25

39

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Chamber Disc (Plastic interior) (51038G166) - MCT Il Parts, 4" Model

$83.25

40

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Bypass Interior Assémb!y (Plastic) (51258G364) - MCT Il Parts, 4" Model

No Bid
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41

5 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Train Cap Gasket (59046) - MCT 1l Parts, 4" Model

$2.25

42

10 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Lower Drive Assembly (Magnetic) (33170) - MCT Il Parts, 4" Model

$42.00

43

5 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Spindle Cap Assembly (44850) - MCT Il Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

44

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Spindle Ball (44826) - MCT I Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

45

5 EA

item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Torrent Spindie/Bushing (Replacement Kit) (44879) - MCT i Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

46

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Spindle Check Nut (44856) - MCT |l Parts, 4" Model

$19.50

47

1 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes: )

Torrent Spindle Complete Assembly (44893) - MCT I Parts, 4" Model

$348.75

48

4 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Weight & Swing Arm Busing (565325) (4) - MCT |l Parts, 4" Model
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49

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Roller and Busing (65362) - MCT Il Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

50

10 EA

ltem Notes: ‘

Supplier Notes:

Clapper (55365) - MCT [l Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

51

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Complete Assembly (565339) - MCT il Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

52

4 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Hinge Spindle Bushing (55307) (4) - MCT 1l Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

53

2 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Swing Arm Hinge Spindle (55379) (2) - MCT 1l Parts, 4" Model

No Bid

54

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

MCT Il PARTS, 6" MODEL - Bypass Top Case Gasket (51068P174)

$4.50

55

5 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Train Cap Gasket (59046) - MCT 1l Parts, 6" Model

$2.25

56

10 EA

ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Lower Drive Assembly (Magnetic) (33170) - MCT Il Parts, 6" Model

$42.00
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57

5 EA

Torrent Spindle Cap Assembly (44950) - MCT Il Parts, 6" Model

No Bid
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
58 10 EA MODEL MCT PARTS, COMPOUND MAGNETIC DRIVE METERS, 3" MODEL - Lower Drive No Bid
Assembly (33148)
litem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
59 4 EA Train Cap Gasket (59046) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 3" Model $2.25
ftem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
60 5 EA Bypass Lower Drive Assembly (31158) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive No Bid
Meters, 3" Model
{tem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
61 1 EA Torrent Cap Assembly (44750) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 3" No Bid
Model
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
62 1 EA Torrent Spindle Ball (44726) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 3" $6.00
Model -
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
63 1 EA Torrent Wheel with Bushing (44711) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, No Bid
3" Model
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
64 1 EA Torrent Spindie (44767) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 3" Model $60.00
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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65

1 EA

Torrent Interior Complete (Bronze) (44748) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive

Meters, 3" Model No Bid
Item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
66 2 EA Torrent Spindle Assembly Complete (44793) - Model MCT Parts, Com i i
, M
e o pound Magnetic Drive $312.75
jtem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
67 10 EA MODEL MCT PARTS, COMPOUND MAGNETIC DRIVE METERS, 4" MODEL i i
, , -L
Aseembly (33148) ower Drive No Bid
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
68 4 EA Train Cap Gasket (59046) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 4" Mode! $2.25
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
68 5 EA Bypass Lower Drive Assembly (31168) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Dri i
Meters, 4" Model ’ P snetie Brve No Bid
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
70 1 EA :Aorrem Cap Assembly (44850) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 4" No Bid
odel '
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
71 1 EA To;\rAent Wheel with Bushing (44811) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters No Bid
4" Model '
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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72

2 EA

Torrent Spindle Assembly Compilete (44893) - Model MCT Parts, Com d M i i
e e , pound Magnetic Drive $348.75
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
73 2 EA Swing Arm (55313) - Mode!l MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 4" Mode! No Bid
item Notes:
Supplier Notes:
74 5 EA Swing Arm Roller with Bushing (55362) - Mode! MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive No Bid
Meters, 4" Model
ltem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
75 5 EA Clapper Rubber (Pre-1972) (55136) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters %26—25*/(;@
4" Model ' /‘J BTb
0
item Notes: Cm b:'g; Al
Supplier Notes:
76 8 EA Clapper Rubber (1972 Design) (55366) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive $26.25
Meters, 4" Model! '
ftem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
77 1 EA Hinge Spindle Bushing (55320) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 4" No Bid
Model ’
ftem Notes:
Supplier Notes:
78 1 EA Hinge Spindie (55379) - Model MCT Parts, Compound Magnetic Drive Meters, 4" Mode! No Bid
ltem Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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79

2 EA

ltern Notes:

Supplier Notes:

MODEL MCT PARTS, COMPOUND MAGNETIC DRIVE METERS, 6" MODEL - Lower Drive No Bid
Assembly (33148)

Response Total: $14,424.75
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. Mueller sysTems!
10210 Statesville Blvd.
P.O. Box 128
Cleveland, NC 27013
Office: 704.278.2221
Fax: 704.278.9616

September 29, 2014

Ms. Sharon Mulder

City of Lincoln, Nebraska
City-County Purchasing Division
440 South 8™ Street, Suite 200
Lincoln, NE 68508

RE: Annual Supply of Hersey Water Meter Parts, Bid No. 14-221

Greetings Ms. Mulder,

Enclosed are the documents pertaining to the subject contract, signed where designated. Please
take note that regarding line item 75 of the enclosed, item 55136 has been discontinued. This item
was a component of the discontinued Model MCTIIL. As stated in the bid submission dated 9/12/14,
most of the components for the MCTII have been discontinued. Many of the remaining parts are
subject to availability.

Please do not hesitate to contact me at 704-278-5355 or ashort@muellersystems.com if you have
any questions. Thank you for giving us the opportunity to be of service to you.

Enclosures



