
 07-017 Annual Requirements for Sanitary Sewer Pipe and Fittings, Public Works, 
Wastewater
January 17, 2007

COMPANY NAME:
REPRESENTATIVE:
ADDRESS:
CITY,STATE,ZIP:
TELEPHONE NO.:
FAX NO.: 620-241-8635 896-6379
E-MAIL ADDRESS:

Item Item Description
Est. 
Qt.

U/M Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1  4" PVC Sewer Pipe (SDR 35) 300 Lf. $0.75 $225.00 $0.71 $213.00
   Manufacturer
   Model

2  6" PVC Sewer Pipe (SDR 35) 300 Lf. $1.59 $477.00 $1.45 $435.00
   Manufacturer
   Model

3  8" PVC Sewer Pipe (SDR 35) 1500 Lf. $2.69 $4,035.00 $2.60 $3,900.00
   Manufacturer
   Model

4  12" PVC Sewer Pipe (SDR 35) 300 Lf. $6.26 $1,878.00 $5.80 $1,740.00
   Manufacturer
   Model

5  4" Clay-to-PVC Coupling 100 Ea $2.60 $260.00 $2.86 $286.00
   Manufacturer Fernco Pipe Conx
   Model 1002-44 PCX02-44

6  6" Clay-to-PVC Coupling 100 Ea $5.55 $555.00 $5.75 $575.00
   Manufacturer Fernco Pipe Conx
   Model 1002-66 PCX02-66

7  8" Clay-to-PVC Coupling 100 Ea $8.55 $855.00 $8.50 $850.00
   Manufacturer Fernco Pipe Conx
   Model 1002-88 PCX02-88

8  10" Clay-to-PVC Coupling 100 Ea $12.89 $1,289.00 $11.50 $1,150.00
   Manufacturer Fernco Pipe Conx
   Model 1002-1010 PCX02-1010

9 12" Clay-to-PVC Coupling 100 Ea $15.04 $1,504.00 $13.52 $1,352.00
   Manufacturer Fernco Pipe Conx
   Model 1002-1212 PCX 02-1212

10  4" Cast Iron-to-PVC Coupling 150 Ea $2.60 $390.00 $2.86 $429.00
   Manufacturer Fernco Pipe Conx
   Model 1056-44 PCX 56-44

11  4" Type O Std. Coupling 100 Ea NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00
   Item No.
   Manufacturer

12  6" Adjustable Repair Coupling 100 Ea NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00
   Item No.
   Manufacturer

13  8" Adjustable Repair Coupling 300 Ea NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00
   Item No.
   Manufacturer

14  10" Adjustable Repair Coupling 50 Ea NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00
   Item No.
   Manufacturer

15  12 Adjustable Repair Coupling 50 Ea NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00
   Item No.
   Manufacturer

16  8" x 4" PVC Tee Saddle (SDR 35) 250 Ea $12.55 $3,137.50 $16.25 $4,062.50
   Manufacturer GPK GPK
   Model 136-0084 136-0084

17  4" PVC Saddle Adapter (SDR 35 -Sch. 40)1000 Ea $4.10 $4,100.00 $5.34 $5,340.00
   Manufacturer GPK GPK
   Model 230-0004 230-0004

18  4" PVC  45 Degree Bend (SDR 35) 200 Ea $1.24 $248.00 $1.77 $354.00
   Manufacturer GPK GPK
   Model 221-0004 221-0004

19  4" PVC 22.5 Degree Bend (SDR 35) 200 Ea $1.41 $282.00 $1.96 $392.00
   Manufacturer GPK GPK
   Model 217-0004 217-0004
Total Bid items 1-19 Combined $19,235.50 $21,078.50
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