07-031 Washer/Extractor Gas Dryer, Co

January 17, 2007

. Corrections

COMPANY NAME:
REPRESENTATIVE:
ADDRESS:
CITY,STATE,ZIP:
TELEPHONE NO.:

R.J. Kool Co.

Larry Pfuff

234 W. 12th Ave.

No. Kansas City, MO 64116
816-474-9274

A.A. Horwath & Sons
Jim Horwath

4230 S. 13th St.
Omaha, NE 68108
402-342-1299

FAX NO: 816-474-2141 402-342-1926
E-MAIL ADDRESS: larry@rjkool.com info@aahorwath.com
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1|Washer- Extractor 1 $6,279.00 $6,279.00 7,190.00 7,190.00 0.00
Make/Model Unimac VW60BZ Milnor 30022 T5E
2|Gas Dryer 2 $3,064.00 | $6,128.00 3,245.00 | 6,490.00 0.00
Make/Model UTO075NOM Huebsch 75 CG
Less Trade-In Allowance
3|Washer- Extractor 1 No Bid No Bid -$100.00 -$100.00 0.00
4|Gas Dryer 2 No Bid No Bid -$100.00 -$200.00 0.00
5|Removal, Delivery & Install 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $970.00 $970.00 0.00
Total $16,407.00 $14,350.00 $0.00




