07-078 The Annual Requirements for Ammunition, Police
March 7, 2007

COMPANY NAME:
REPRESENTATIVE:
ADDRESS:
CITY,STATE,ZIP:
TELEPHONE/FAX NO.:
E-MAIL ADDRESS

Central States Tactical, Inc.
Jeff Hallgren

2601 N. 27th St.

Lincoln, NE 68521
402.465.0213\465.0218
jhallgren@cstneb.com

Precision Delta Corp.

Patricia Lott
PO Box 128

Ruleville, MS 38771

662.756.2810\662.756.2590

precdelta@tecinfo.com

Ultramax Ammunition

Lona Ulmer

2112 Elk Vale Rd

Rapid City SD 57701
800-345-5852/605-342-8727
ultramax@amerion.com

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.
Gail Walker-Keen

7750 9th Street SW

Vero Beach, FL 32968
772-569-8700/772/569/2955
gail@lawmens.net

Item Item Description Qty. /M Per/M Total Per/M Total Per/M Total Per/M Total
1|.38 Caliber marksmanship Team - LPD 30 $179.00 $5,370.00 $103.00 $3,090.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer Reimgton Precison Delta
D148WCRFBE
Product Code R3853 must have brass of exchange
2|.38 caliber 148 grain, PD D148WCRF - LPD 6 179.00 $1,074.00 $214.00| $1,284.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
P14838F - New Match
3|.38 Caliber 158 grain, Brass Exchange - LPD 10 179.00 $1,790.00 $104.50| $1,045.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington Must have brass for exchange
R38S14
4/.38 Caliber 158 grain, PD D158SWRF - LPD 4 179.00| $716.00 $220.00 $880.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington
R38S14
5/9MM Marksmanship - Brass exchange - LPD 10 180.00| $1,800.00 $118.00 $1,180.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
10| Remington $214.00 $2,140.00
L9MM9 Precision Delta Corp.
D147FMRBE - Full Metal Jacket
w/Brass Exch.
Alt: D147JHPBE - JHP wi/brass
Ex
6]9MM Marksmanship PD D147JHP - LPD 4 210.00 $840.00 $298.00| $1,192.00 $164.00 $656.00 No Bid $0.00
P9147JHP - New Match Federal 9MS
7|9MM Practice 15 195.45 $2,931.75 No Bid $0.00 $126.00| $1,890.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington Federal
LOMM2 AE9D9
8/9MM Duty - LPD 6) 289.30 $1,735.80 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
9].45 Duty - Sheriff 5 N/B $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $298.00 $1,490.00 No Bid $0.00
10(.45 ACP Caliber Practice - LPD 110 209.00 $22,990.00 No Bid $0.00 $179.00 $19,690.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington Federal
L45AP4 AE45A
11|.45 ACP Caliber Duty - LPD 12 339.00 $4,068.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
12|Shotgun Duty 2.5 N/B $0.00 $602.00 $1,505.00 No Bid $0.00 $556.60 $1,391.50
13|SWAT Shotgun Rifled Slugs - Duty 2 331.00 $662.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington
SP12RS
14|.223 Caliber Rifle Duty Ammo. - LPD 30 256.00| $7,680.00 No Bid $0.00 $244.00 $7,320.00 $218.68 $6,560.40
Remington Federal * 6-8 Month lead time Hornady
L223R3 AE223 9754
15|SWAT .308 Caliber Rifle Ammo. - LPD 1.5 490.00| $735.00 No Bid $0.00 $548.00| $822.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington
RM308W7 168qr Bth Match GM 308M-Federal
16|B-27 E Target 2,000 | $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid| $0.00 $0.92 $1,840.00
Manufacturer Remington Speedwell
Product Code RM308W?7 168qr bth match B27E
B-27C 12 %" x 18 1/2" Repair Center for NRA B-
17|27E Target 1,000 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.10 $100.00
Manufacturer Speedwell
Product Code B27C
18|Q-CB BFI Center Mass Target 4,000 [ $0.00 No Bid| $0.00 No Bid| $0.00 $0.70] $2,800.00
Manufacturer Speedwell
Product Code Q-CB
19|12 Gauge Shotgun AA Trap Loads 2.5 169.00| $422.50 No Bid| $0.00 $160.00| $400.00 No Bid| $0.00
Manufacturer Remington Federal
Product Code GL128 TGL12
20|.40 Caliber Practice 45 189.00| $8,505.00 No Bid $0.00 $l49.60| $6,732.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington Federal
L40SW3
21|.40 Caliber Duty 7.5 275.00 $2,062.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
22|.223 Caliber Rifle Duty Ammo - Sheriff 10 N/B $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $523.60 $5,236.00
23|Shotgun Reduced Recoil Loads - Duty 2.5 331.00 $827.50 No Bid $0.00 $296.00 $740.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington Federal
RR128B00 LE13300
24|Shotgun Reduced Recoil Slugs - Swat 2 331.00 $662.00 No Bid $0.00] No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
25|Shotgun Reduced Recoil Loads, 8 pellet - Duty 2.5 331.00 $827.50 $420.00 $1,050.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington
RR128Boo
26|Shotgun Reduced Recoil Loads, 9 pellet - Duty 2.5 324.75| $811.88 $420.00 $1,050.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington
RR128K00
27|Shotgun Reduced Recoil Slugs - Swat 2 331.00| $662.00 $450.00 $900.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Remington
RR12RS
28(.308 Caliber Rifle Duty Ammo - Sherrif 1 490.00| $490.00 $889.00 $889.00 No Bid $0.00 $796.40 $796.40
Remington
Rm308W7 80975




