
 07-190  Electrical Supplies Light Fixtures, Public Building Commission  
June 20, 2007

COMPANY NAME:
REPRESENTATIVE:
ADDRESS:
CITY,STATE,ZIP:
TELEPHONE NO.:
FAX NO.: 402-476-2718 402-476-3415 402-467-3779 402-467-5209
E-MAIL ADDRESS:

Item Item Description
Est. 
Qt.

U/M Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 2'X4" Flour Troffers (Spec. 4) 125 ea. $60.86 $7,607.50 $59.20 $7,400.00 $52.20 $6,525.00 $50.58 $6,322.50
Manufacturer

2 2'X4" Flour Troffers (Spec. 5) 62 ea. $38.71 $2,400.02 $47.35 $2,935.70 $40.00 $2,480.00 $39.00 $2,418.00
Manufacturer

3 Recess. Rd Vert. Lamp 70 ea. $69.60 $4,872.00 $71.05 $4,973.50 $71.20 $4,984.00 $67.40 $4,718.00
Manufacturer

4 8' Susp. Flour. Fixture 4 ea. $400.87 $1,603.48 $370.70 $1,482.80 $417.50 $1,670.00 $426.95 $1,707.80
Manufacturer

5 2'x2' Fluor. Troffer (Spec. 8) 1 ea. $54.78 $54.78 $47.35 $47.35 $47.00 $47.00 $39.00 $39.00
Manufacturer

6 2'x2' Fluor. Troffer (Spec. 9) 1 ea. $54.89 $54.89 $59.20 $59.20 $57.30 $57.30 $55.00 $55.00
Manufacturer

7 2'x4' Fluor. Troffer (Spec. 10) 1 ea. $55.56 $55.56 $65.35 $65.35 $57.20 $57.20 $54.50 $54.50
Manufacturer

8 2'x4' Fluor. Troffer (Spec. 11) 4 ea. $51.47 $205.88 $62.80 $251.20 $53.30 $213.20 $52.80 $211.20
Manufacturer

9 Recess. Rd Vert. Lamp 4 ea. $69.56 $278.24 $71.05 $284.20 $71.20 $284.80 $67.45 $269.80
Manufacturer

10 All Purp. Fluor. 6 ea. $53.85 $323.10 $187.85 $1,127.10 $56.20 $337.20 $53.95 $323.70
Manufacturer

11 Exit Light (Spec. 14) 26 ea. $18.69 $485.94 $72.05 $1,873.30 $19.55 $508.30 $20.15 $523.90
Manufacturer

12 Exit Light (Spec. 15) 10 ea. $18.69 $186.90 $72.05 $720.50 $19.55 $195.50 $20.15 $201.50
Manufacturer

13 Emergency Light 43 ea. $39.58 $1,701.94 $39.10 $1,681.30 $41.30 $1,775.90 $42.70 $1,836.10
Manufacturer

14 Indus. Fluorescent 10 ea. $39.08 $390.80 $35.10 $351.00 $40.35 $403.50 $39.45 $394.50
Manufacturer

15 1'x4' Fluor. Wrap Around 13 ea. $143.14 $1,860.82 $115.85 $1,506.05 $149.00 $1,937.00 $151.70 $1,972.10
Manufacturer

16 Undercounter Light 2 ea. $86.10 $172.20 $56.65 $113.30 $90.00 $180.00 $91.50 $183.00
Manufacturer

17 Up and Down Light 2 ea. $87.18 $174.36 No Bid $0.00 $100.00 $200.00 $90.00 $180.00
Manufacturer
Total Part 1 $22,428.41 $24,871.85 $21,855.90 $21,410.60
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1 Single Pole 90 ea. No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $1.67 $150.30 $2.62 $235.80
Manufacturer

2 Three-Way 30 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $2.06 $61.80 $3.20 $96.00
Manufacturer

3 Four-Way 4 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $6.70 $26.80 $8.72 $34.88
Manufacturer

4 Pass 414 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.28 $529.92 $3.02 $1,250.28
Manufacturer

5 20 amp, GFCI 20 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $9.75 $195.00 $11.05 $221.00
Manufacturer

ea.
6 1 Device Switch 55 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.62 $34.10 $0.70 $38.50

Manufacturer
7 2 Device Switch 50 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.23 $61.50 $1.40 $70.00

Manufacturer
8 1 Device Receptacle 242 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.62 $150.04 $0.70 $169.40

Manufacturer
9 1 Device Recp. GFCI 20 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.62 $12.40 $0.70 $14.00

Manufacturer
10 2 Device Recep. 24 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.23 $29.52 $1.40 $33.60

Manufacturer

11 Ceiling Mounts 48 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $56.40 $2,707.20 $81.00 $3,888.00
Manufacturer

48 ea. $27.73 $1,331.04

12 Wall Mount 2 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $39.00 $78.00 $39.50 $79.00
Manufacturer

13 Wiremold 4 compart. 3 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $180.00 $540.00 $86.37 $259.11
Manufacturer

14 Domestic Water Heater 3 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $111.00 $333.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

15 Chilled Water Circ. Pump 2 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $866.00 $1,732.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

Occupancy Sensors

Floor Box

Switches

Convenience Outlets

Device Covers

Leviton 1221SGY P&S PS20AC1-GRY

Leviton 1223SGY P&S PS20AC3-GRY

Leviton 1224SGY P&S PS20AC4-GRY

Leviton 5362GYS P&S 5362-GRY

Leviton 7899SGY P&S 2095-GRY

Leviton 84001-40 P&S SS1

Leviton 84009-40 P&S SS2

Leviton 84003-40 P&S SS8

Leviton 84401-40 P&S SS26

Leviton 84016-40 P&S SS82

Leviton OOCOSI1W P&S WS1001

Leviton OASIOID P&S WSP200-GRY

WireMold Wiremold RFB-4

CutlerHammer/Eaton DH361 URK

CutlerHammer/Eaton Fused NEMA 1

P&S WS1001 w/PWP120
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16 Elevator 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1,263.00 $1,263.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

17 Hot Water Pump 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $712.00 $712.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

18 Wxist. Sewage Ejection 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $67.30 $67.30 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

19 Elevator Car 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $138.70 $138.70 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

20 Break Glass Station #20 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $210.00 $210.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

21 Time Clock Sheet E-100 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $735.00 $735.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

22 Manual Motor Starter 9 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $92.00 $828.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

23 Domestic Water Pump 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $28.00 $28.00 No Bid $0.00
Manufacturer

EMT Conduit ea.
24 3/4" 12,000 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $34.20 $4,104.00 $36.27 $4,352.40
25 1" 100 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $48.40 $48.40 $58.00 $58.00
26 1 1/4" 150 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $84.30 $126.45 $89.42 $134.13

Extra Flex Conduit
27 1 1/4" 15 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $89.50 $13.43 $143.77 $21.57
28 1" 10 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $66.90 $6.69 $121.93 $12.19
29 3/4" 50 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $35.90 $17.95 $101.40 $50.70
30 1/2" 50 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $27.60 $13.80 $79.58 $39.79
31 3/8" 100 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $25.40 $25.40 $61.60 $61.60

EMT Compression Connectors
32 3/4" 1,100 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.21 $231.00 $45.48 $500.28
33 1" 4 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.43 $1.72 $77.52 $3.10
34 1 1/4" 8 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.71 $5.68 $129.30 $10.34

Flex Connector, Straight
35 1 1/4" 4 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $4.30 $17.20 $341.36 $13.65
36 1" 2 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $2.50 $5.00 $166.63 $3.33
37 3/4" 10 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.05 $10.50 $67.67 $6.77
38 1/2" 50 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.60 $30.00 $43.95 $21.98
39 3/8" 50 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.46 $23.00 $36.17 $18.09

Flex Connector, 90 Degrees

CutlerHammer/Eaton Fused NEMA 1

CutlerHammer/Eaton Fused NEMA 1

CutlerHam./Eaton DH321NGK 240V

C.H./Eaton DH361NGK 600V Nema 1

InterMatic ET70815CR

C.H./Eaton 10250TGS, TGL & TEP76

InterMatic EI500C

C.H./Eaton MST01SN MSH Heater
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40 1 1/4" 2 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $8.40 $16.80 $497.15 $9.94
41 1" 1 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $5.50 $5.50 $418.15 $4.18
42 3/4" 5 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $2.30 $11.50 $162.56 $8.13
43 1/2" 10 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.91 $9.10 $65.87 $6.59
44 3/8" 20 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.65 $13.00 $50.35 $10.07

EMT Compression Couplings
45 3/4" 2,000 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.26 $520.00 $52.97 $1,059.40
46 1" 10 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.47 $4.70 $86.56 $8.66
47 1 1/4" 20 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.83 $16.60 $156.28 $31.26

Steel Threaded Couplings
48 3/4" 10 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.87 $8.70 $47.44 $4.74
49 1" 2 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.24 $2.48 $68.60 $1.37
50 1 1/4" 2 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.60 $3.20 $130.23 $2.60

Combination Boxes
51 4 x 4 x 1 & 1/5"D 1/2" - 3/4" KO 200 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.42 $84.00 $40.49 $80.98
52 4 x 4 x 2 & 1/8"D 1/2" - 3/4" KO 400 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.69 $276.00 $76.66 $306.64
53 4 x 4 x 2 & 1/8"D 3/4" - 3/4" KO 300 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.74 $222.00 $110.79 $332.37
54 4 x 4 x 1 & 5/8"D 3/4" - 3/4" KO 200 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.45 $90.00 $69.21 $138.42

Plaster Rings 5/8" Raised
55 4" x 4"/1 gang 400 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.26 $104.00 $31.80 $127.20
56 4" x 4"/2 gang 200 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.34 $68.00 $41.08 $82.16
57 4 x 4 Blank Steel Box Cover 500 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.18 $90.00 $24.04 $120.20

Mounting Material
58 Metal stud fastener 400 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.48 $192.00 $51.78 $207.12
59 Box support clip 400 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.24 $96.00 $25.26 $101.04
60 8 12 M 24 Bottom Conduit hanger 1,500 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.75 $1,125.00 $81.15 $1,217.25
61 350 8 12 M Side conduit hanger 300 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.64 $192.00 $65.60 $196.80
62 8 12 MF 1/2"-3/4" cond, to met, stud 1,500 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.77 $1,155.00 $70.70 $1,060.50
63 12 P 12 3/4"-3/4 Back to Bck 300 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.57 $171.00 $61.35 $184.05
64 Caddy SGB16D Box Bracket 200 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.56 $312.00 $118.53 $237.06
65 Steel City 318 1/4/20 Beam Clamp 200 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.50 $100.00 $53.15 $106.30
66 Caddy SGB16D Box Bracket 200 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.56 $312.00 $118.53 $237.06
67 Steel City 318 1/4/20 Beam 100 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.59 $59.00 $57.44 $57.44
68 1 & 5/8" unistrut channel 40 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $120.00 $48.00 $147.85 $59.14
69 7/8" unistrut channel 40 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $102.00 $40.80 $119.30 $47.72

Unistrut Conduit Straps
70 3/4" c 82 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.40 $32.80 $58.74 $48.17
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71 1" c 9 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.46 $4.14 $63.31 $5.70
72 1 1/4" c 18 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $0.52 $9.36 $71.42 $12.86

Combination Connector
73 3/4" conduit to 3/4" flex 10 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $2.50 $25.00 $204.52 $20.45
74 3/4" conduit to 1/2" flex 25 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $2.25 $56.25 No Bid $0.00
75 3/4" conduit to 3/8" flex 50 ea. $0.00 $0.00 $1.30 $65.00 No Bid $0.00

#12 THHN Stranded Wire
76 Black 8,500 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $858.50 $106.47 $905.00
77 Red 9,500 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $959.50 $106.47 $1,011.47
78 Blue 6,500 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $656.50 $106.47 $692.06
79 White 11,000 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $1,111.00 $106.47 $1,171.17
80 Green 6,000 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $606.00 $106.47 $638.82
81 Orange 3,000 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $303.00 $106.47 $319.41
80 Purple 3,000 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $303.00 $106.47 $319.41
83 Brown 1,500 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.101 $151.50 $106.47 $159.71

#10 THWN Stranded Wire
84 Black 1,500 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.172 $258.00 $106.47 $159.71
85 Green 500 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.172 $86.00 $106.47 $53.24
86 #8 Black 200 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.305 $61.00 $275.44 $55.09
87 #6 Black 100 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.414 $41.40 $422.13 $42.21
88 #4 Black 250 ft. $0.00 $0.00 $0.664 $166.00 $664.36 $166.09

Total Part 2
Total Part 1 and 2


