South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee
Final Report Submitted to the

South of Downtown Coordinated Steering Committee
June 11, 2019

gy -
9% e
¥

\‘J'

S
l'N

CITY OF o e

SOUTH
INCOLN sownrown
h 4

NEBRASKA

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19

- e
== :
— :
dit
1 f i &
A 2 5
‘ :
2 . E 1
. 4 “;j
f > i

b
-



Affordable Housing Subcommittee Membership

Dan Marvin
Misha Coleman
Chelsea Egenberger
Carl Eskridge
Lynn Fisher
Josh Hanshaw
Thomas Judds
Jose Lemus
Cassey Lottman
Penny McCord
Russ Meyer

Michon Morrow

Steve Peregrine

Pat Anderson-Sifuentez
Sean Stewart

John Turner

Brent Williams

Staff

Chair, Urban Development Department Director
Neighborhood Representative
Neighborhood Representative

Lincoln City Council

Great Place Properties

Habitat for Humanity of Lincoln

Lincoln Housing Authority

Civic Nebraska/Collective Impact Lincoln
Neighborhood Representative

Near South Neighborhood Association
Nebraska Home Sales

Lincoln Police Department, SW Team Captain
Nebraska Housing Resource

NeighborWorks-Lincoln, Everett Neighborhood Association

City Building & Safety, Chief Housing Inspector
Nebraska Investment Finance Authority (NIFA)
Excel Development Group

Shawn Ryba
Isabel Salas
Wynn Hjermstad

South of Downtown Community Development Organization
South of Downtown Community Development Organization
City of Lincoln, Urban Development Department

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



Table of Contents

R 111 oY LTt o o 5
a. History of affordable housing initiative in South of Downtown ...........cccoeeciveeeiinenn. 5
b. Defining affordability.........ccueie i 6
C. HOUSING QUANILY oot e e e e e e e e e e s e e ereeeeeeeeas 6
2. Housing Subcommittee Recommendations .........ccceiiieiiiimiiiinciiiiiiinnee. 6
Q. SUNMIMAIY FEPOIT ..eetiiiiiieieeeriiirteree e e e sssrrreereeesssssarrereeeesssssssssreeaseesesssssssssennseeeesssssnssrnenes 6
i. Strategies that iNCrease SUPPIY .......o.eueeeeeeeeeieeeeeeeecieeeeee e eeeccceeeea e e e s 7
ii. Strategies that preserve And Protect ..........ccoueeeevvveeeeeeeeeeeeiiiiieeeeeeeeesccivnnes 8
D. €S STUAIES ...t 10
[ VOCANT PIOPEITIES ..ottt ettt ettt e s ssae e e s ssaeesesaee 10
ii. Opportunities to Add dENSItY ..........ccouevvueeceeciesieeiiecieseeee et e e e eesie e 12
TR oo (=R =14} (o) (o114 =1 SRS 14
V. Preservation Of @XiStinNgG ..........cceecueciuesiueeiieesiiesieesieeseesiessseessesseesssssssessssesseas 17
(OB o o g1 1 74= 4[] o TP PRTTOPPRPPRRPIRN 19
K JR 0 T 1 T] 7o T N 19
Appendix

Available online:
https://lincoln.ne.gov/city/urban/reports/pdf/AffordableHousing-Appendix-2019.pdf

The Appendix contains the Coordinated Steering Committee membership roster, the
Subcommittee membership roster, meeting agendas, minutes, and materials.

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19


https://lincoln.ne.gov/city/urban/reports/pdf/AffordableHousing-Appendix-2019.pdf

This page intentionally blank

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



1. Introduction

Housing affordability is an issue that is being addressed on many levels, from the National
or State level, to the local level. The Lincoln Chamber of Commerce made housing
affordability one of their six key issues for 2019. Earlier this year the Omaha World Herald
penned an editorial describing affordability and its impact on the state’s economy.

Seattle has been at the forefront of addressing
what they term a “crisis” of affordable housing.
Lincoln is not experiencing a “crisis” to the degree
of cities like Denver or San Francisco where neglect
of the issue has led to the disappearance of
affordable housing. Realizing the urgency to
address the housing adequacy and affordability
issue can help resolve the problem before it
worsens. Lincoln is approximately 5,000 housing
units short of available rental housing units
accessible to households at 50% or below of the
area median income (AMI) (Source: US
Department of Housing and Urban Development

(HUD) CHAS data).

History of affordable housing initiative in South of Downtown

In 2016, community stakeholders, with the assistance of H-3 Planning Consultants,
formulated the South of Downtown Revitalization Plan (the H-3 Plan). The H-3 Plan
compiled a wealth of planning data for the area. One of its key recommendations has
been implemented - the creation of the South of Downtown Community
Development Organization (CDO). Building on the community input and data analysis
of the H-3 Plan, and in response to housing and other issues in the area, the CDO and
the City of Lincoln are partnering to enhance South of Downtown attributes and
gualities, while addressing important neighborhood concerns and issues. To carry out
this purpose, the South of Downtown Coordinated Steering Committee was formed to
work with the CDO, the City of Lincoln and other key stakeholders and community
members in defining and collaborating on action strategies and redevelopment
projects for the South of Downtown area: 10th to 17th, A to L Streets (Census Tracts
20.01 and 20.02). Steering Committee members are included in the Appendix.
Several Subcommittees were formed to focus on areas of concern including quality
affordable housing; neighborhood blight and deterioration; zoning and land use
regulations and incentives; economic opportunity; actual and perceived sense of
safety; CDO sustainability; and recreational opportunities.

This report summarizes the work and recommendations of the Affordable Quality
Housing Subcommittee. Beginning in November 2018, the Subcommittee met twice a
month with City Departments, local stakeholders, attorneys, the University of
Nebraska- Lincoln and neighborhood activists to craft “strategies” to get out in front
of this issue before it becomes a “crisis”. Subcommittee members and meeting

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19


https://www.omaha.com/opinion/editorial-nebraska-continues-to-embrace-new-ideas-to-address-its/article_5ae43889-5cb2-5226-a15a-3e30d698a154.html

minutes are included in the Appendix. An Executive Committee comprised of the
Subcommittee Chair and staff also met every two weeks to prepare agenda items and
carry out other work and research of the Subcommittee.

Defining affordability

Subcommittee members discussed defining affordability, i.e., affordable to whom?
After considerable discussion and review of data (see Appendix, December 18, 2018
Meeting 2 Meeting Notes) there was consensus that defining affordable housing for
this group will be focused on households with incomes between 30-80% of Area
Median Income (AMI). The Lincoln Homeless Coalition’s focus is on households with
incomes at 30% or less of AMI and a member of the Subcommittee is involved in the
Homeless Coalition and served as a liaison between that group and the
Subcommittee. AMI of 60% or less is considered low income. Housing cost burden
(over 30% of income paid for housing, including utilities) and severe cost burden
(over 50% of income paid for housing) were also discussed by the Committee and
data reviewed indicated that households in the 30-80% AMI range are likely to be
cost burdened.

Housing quality

Housing affordability cannot be =
addressed only on the issue of

apartment rental rates. City of Omaha: 2,500 code violations and

Affordable quality housing is a counting at the Yale Park apartment complex
significant issue identified by . _

the Subcommittee and also

through public outreach efforts

by various groups including the CDO, NeighborWorks Lincoln, and Collective Impact
Lincoln. Code enforcement to provide living standards that avoid subjecting
residents to living in slum conditions was also a priority of the Subcommittee. This
too is not unique to Lincoln. Omaha has experienced multiple cases of egregious
code violations in “affordable housing” units.

TIONS  TODAY'S E-EDITION NEWSLETTERS BUY & SELL

By Erin Dufty and Emily Noh / World-Heral »2

Code violations have forced some communities to address mandatory inspection of
rental properties. The Subcommittee looked at ordinances in South Sioux City and
Omaha that are a reaction to difficulty in code enforcement. Omaha’s City Council
recently passed such legislation.

Housing Subcommittee Recommendations

a. Summaryreport

The Subcommittee looked at a number of housing related issues and soon decided
that one size does not fit all in addressing housing affordability. Instead, the
Subcommittee looked at “strategies” to address various forms of housing affordability
and equally important, its quality.

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19


https://www.omaha.com/news/metro/i-m-through-playing-nice-omaha-officials-signal-openness-to/article_16dc811e-b27a-51ee-9b55-fd1a1ea1d1c5.html
https://www.omaha.com/money/omaha-gets-landlord-registry-regular-inspections-after-stothert-puts-away/article_b8821a21-23b7-5c19-80d9-27de84c51ce8.html
https://www.omaha.com/money/omaha-gets-landlord-registry-regular-inspections-after-stothert-puts-away/article_b8821a21-23b7-5c19-80d9-27de84c51ce8.html
https://www.omaha.com/money/omaha-gets-landlord-registry-regular-inspections-after-stothert-puts-away/article_b8821a21-23b7-5c19-80d9-27de84c51ce8.html

Small and large group discussions occurred for several meetings to identify strategies.
To assist in this effort, case studies were used to examine the four common types of
properties that have potential to best address the issues of adequacy and affordability.

Recommendations are summarized below. The strategies

are classified into two categories: 1) those that increase the

supply of affordable housing, and 2) those that preserve

and protect existing affordable housing. See Section b. URE

Case Studies, for more details about the discussion. After

completing the Case Studies exercise, additional strategies

were identified and are not included in the discussion in

Section b. Those strategies are indicated below with an

asterisk. Finally, the Subcommittee completed a

prioritization process through a dot exercise (discussed in Section c.). In the recommended
strategies summarized below, numbers in parenthesis indicate the number of dots received.
It should be noted that all of the strategies listed are recommended by the Subcommittee
but those with numbers were identified as higher priority. It is important to note that
Subcommittee members recognized there are divided opinions on certain strategies without
full consensus, particularly where more information is needed. Chief among these are
inclusionary zoning, land banks, and up-zoning in the rest of the city.

i.  Strategies that increase supply
e Increase the city’s affordable housing fund, funded by TIF administration
fees, Turnback Tax, and other sources. (9)

e Establish a Community Land Trust to purchase parking lots, existing
property, and vacant properties. (8)

e Use a layered approach to financing developments including federal
HOME funds, Federal Home Loan Bank AHP (Affordable Housing Program)
funds, trust funds, CDBG, NIFA (Workforce Housing), Low Income Housing
Tax Credits (LIHTC) and charitable sources. (8)

e Identify city sources of funding for acquisition, demolition, and
rehabilitation programs. (8)

e Develop a registry of vacant properties: (7)
o Define criteria for registration
o Create a system to measure/keep inventory
o Define timelines/strategies for review of vacant properties
o Develop a plan of action for addressing vacant properties
e Expand code enforcement services: (7)
o Strengthen the implementation of the Neglected Building Ordinance

o Identify funding for additional code inspectors

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



8

o Notify mortgage holder & insurer to resolve or move to foreclosure or
purchase and tie foreclosure and purchase to Community Land Trust

and/or Land Bank

e Acquire parking lots for PUDs (Planned Unit Developments) that include
mixed-use redevelopment with affordable and market rate housing and
commercial community needs such as groceries, daycare, social services,

etc. (5)

e Allow flexibility of zoning/setbacks and easements to allow construction
of affordable housing on non-buildable lots. (5)
Pursue private investors to use Opportunity Zone tax credits. (2)
Relax restrictions such as parking requirements that prevent affordable

housing. (1)

Explore Inclusionary Zoning. (1)
Explore a land bank to better use vacant lots and properties, including

acquisition.

e Use TIF for a combination of affordable and market rate housing as well

as commercial uses.

e Require development of affordable housing for the use of TIF.

® Remove barriers for co-op housing models.

e Explore assisting elderly homeowners in transitioning to non-single family
homes and connecting new homebuyers to available properties.

® Incentivize developers by providing subsidies for new development as

well as rehab.

ii.  Strategies that preserve and
protect existing affordable
housing

e More focused code
enforcement on unsafe,
unhealthy and improperly
maintained properties
within a specific
geographic area. (7)

e Develop a Supplemental
Property Management
Training program led by

y s
A (i 2,
He g oy i
-4 Gt e, Tltmns N
+5- Skdﬁ s 2 '7’*/"&45 S, s L
+M Zm.,\_’ ras iatio o M 1 S
S ~vela), Ity W Traoeat
~ HBe :'6“'“'-7 baly b qeop™es YUK S lnarnmey
e " Haboy L WRVRS - “
=+ = X S to-ns
M2 T s,
OBGan. oy sgvmnd fothen Proriseins Zohi T S popeiey e
C v Ragg .)cﬁ/aa';?ﬂ' rm}g& “"f‘:“ fo:::i\"kr
4+ Forels ~LES o s ettt o g

T For offordo’da W ““»:“; o
conte S0, i
3 —odd ™ Ll g g o

FHC oo Jord st Tiuk
T * Bankes (pryrtia  ferrikFym)
+4=7 Ty 2077 Guirehy-
++ Raheb - vodl ¢ s
2t +T 1 F as madive Hbuld

SRS et
o o R
Y wh nvees

&"__,__L--#—-—"“

\\f/wl\_!

Lpenonunity

b?wa(wh”' erfy i

Land Trust

Building and Safety, Lincoln Police Department, and the Commission on

Human Rights. (6)

o Training should include content on landlord responsibilities
including fair housing, information that should be relayed to new

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee

6-11-19



tenants, and further explanation of landlord and tenant
responsibilities.
® Increase Tenant Education including both literature and trainings available
in multiple languages. (6)
o Provide interpreters for the Building and safety Department.
e Create/expand rehabilitation programs and incentives tied to other
strategies. (5)
e Explore a Proactive Inspection Program. (3)

e Modify the LES sustainable energy fund to benefit more rental properties.
(2)

e Add content on adequacy of property management to Landlord
Education/Real Estate Licensees and Broker Licensing education
requirements. (1)

® Explore increasing fees and penalties for code violations and for
properties on the Neglected Building Registry. (1)

® Increase awareness of and encourage more reporting of code violations
through code violation notices to tenants in the case of valid complaints.
(1)

e Expand the use of co-op housing to preserve existing housing choices. (1)

e Pursue letter-writing campaign partnerships to encourage property
owners and managers to better maintain their properties. (1)

e Explore multi-generational housing models that allow aging in place; i.e.,
caregiver moves in to care for elderly person(s) allowing elder(s) to remain
in home while providing housing for care giver. (1)

e Partner with nonprofit legal aid organizations to provide legal
representation for tenants in eviction proceedings.

e When 3 valid complaints inside a rental unit trigger inspection of an entire
building, require the landlord to attend Supplemental Property
Management Training.

e Adopt the International Property Maintenance Code (building codes
specific to rehabilitation) to increase investment in older properties.

e Expand use of the “small TIF” program with preferences for affordable
housing.

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



10
b. Case studies

Case studies were used to examine the four common types of properties that have
potential to best address the issues of adequacy and affordability. As mentioned
above, a one-size-fits-all approach will not be effective in addressing the nuances of
the housing issue in Lincoln and South of Downtown. Multiple strategies need to be
employed and some strategies work better in different instances of preserving
affordability and improving adequacy of housing. The case studies encompassed the
following topics that were discussed by the Subcommittee: Vacant Properties;
Opportunities to Add Density; Code Enforcement; and Preservation of Existing
Affordable Housing.

i.  Vacant properties
Vacant properties: a solution to access and supply of affordable housing

Vacant properties are not new to cities, including Lincoln. Unfortunately,
there are not streamlined standards to measure the scope of the issue in
Lincoln. According to census figures, which measure “other vacant” units, it
is defined as those neither on the market, held for future occupancy, nor
used only seasonally. There is a need by the City of Lincoln to define vacant
properties and to identify the extent of the problem of vacant properties.

Usually, most redevelopment plans and projects focus on addition—new
housing, transportation, and public spaces and do not focus on vacant
properties as a solution to addressing decency, access and supply of
affordable housing. With vacant properties placing severe fiscal strain on
cities, the properties that are in disrepair have the following effects:
reducing property tax revenue while costing thousands of dollars for
policing; repeated inspections; continual cleaning and upkeep; and in many
cases, demolition. On the other hand, properties that are not in such
extreme states of disrepair could provide opportunities for increasing
affordable housing if there was a catalog of where these vacant properties
were, how to get in contact with property owners, and efforts to explore the
possibility of sale to a land bank, a community land trust, or other housing
entities.

One challenge for
Lincoln is that there is
no consistent survey,
method, or practice
to measure the
extent of the vacant
property problem
and its significance.
Creating a way to
track or measure
vacant properties
would be a valuable

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



11
first step to identifying effective strategies to address the city’s affordable

housing needs.
Vacant neglected properties

Seen as eyesores, public safety hazards, and crime magnets, abandoned
houses represent a real financial drain on both neighbors, sense of
community, and Lincoln at large. Neighborhood fragmentation and
community isolation— the sense no one cares, and things are not getting
better—are powerful side effects. Though harder to quantify, the
community is impacted by vacant properties in their neighborhood.

True costs to cities have been examined in various studies, and it can be
staggering. As an example, a study of vacant property in Toledo found that
they cost the city $3.8 million annually in direct cost, as well as $2.7 million
in lost tax revenues. But the impact they have on their surroundings was
even more significant: $98.7 million in lost property value, and an estimated
$2.68 million in lost property tax value due to the perceived decline in value
from being near vacant buildings. This is just one example of costs to cities
that, like Lincoln, continue to take on as a result of not addressing the issue.

Currently, the city has a neglected building ordinance which requires
property owners to pay a fee to register their property as a neglected
building and must submit a two-year improvement plan for the property.
Liens can be placed on the property if non-compliant. However, there are
not sufficient city resources and processes to ensure property is improved or
that property is sold. Property then often gets bogged down in the court
system. This current ordinance is limited in scope due to property
identification through the complaint-only basis and does not apply to all
vacant, dilapidated properties within the city. Furthermore, having a vacant,
dilapidated property is not found to be unlawful by current code if it is
“properly” secured and exterior code violations are corrected. The
committee affirmed that criteria for vacant and nuisance properties must be
defined and new thresholds, standards, and processes be established.

The South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee discussed a
diverse set of solutions to addressing vacant properties. Possible solutions
include:

Recommendations:

e Establish Community Land Trust for vacant lots and properties
e Explore aland bank

e |dentify city sources of funding for acquisition,
demolition, inspections and rehabilitation programs

e Develop a registry of vacant properties
- Define criteria for registration
- Create a system to measure/keep inventory

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19


http://www.toledoblade.com/frontpage/2008/07/19/Workshop-targets-Toledo-s-vacant-house-issue.html

12
- Define timelines/strategies for review of vacant properties

- Develop a plan of action for addressing vacant properties
e Expand code enforcement services:
o More focused code enforcement on dilapidated
properties within a specific geographic area.
o Strengthen the Neglected Building Ordinance (liens,
fines, additional inspection triggers).
Identify funding for additional code inspectors

o Notify mortgage holder and insurer to resolve or move to
foreclosure or purchase and tie foreclosure and purchase
to Community Land Trust and/or Land Bank.

e Allow flexibility of zoning/setbacks/easements for non-
conforming property lots.

e Expand rehabilitation programs and tie incentives to other strategies.
ii.  Opportunities to add density

Another charge of the Subcommittee is to

consider policies and actions that encourage a ““ TPRIVATE __
variety of housing choices including affordable PARKING
and market rate housing for both = /1 LOT
homeownership and rental opportunities. The 14 Ll Ry
Subcommittee members discussed acquiring VN
large vacant parcels — particularly surface e MURIR LS

parking lots — to grow the supply of affordable
housing, market rate housing, and create mixed-
use development. While parking lots serve a
purpose in the South of Downtown
neighborhoods, they are also an opportunity for
higher density use considering the lack of
buildable lots and property. Recognizing that
neighborhoods need a range of housing options,
the acquisition and redevelopment of parking
lots provides that opportunity. Many of these
surface lots run along 11th and 12th street. The Downtown Master Plan
envisions 11t Street as a “Greenway” corridor that connects to the Everett
Neighborhood.

Subcommittee members recognized that cost of acquisition presents a
barrier to redeveloping surface parking lots. High land costs create a barrier
to building affordable housing units. As a result, many strategies and
actions focus on funding in addition to other aspects of the issue:

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



Recommendations:

Establish a Community Land Trust to purchase surface
parking lots.

Use Low Income Housing Tax Credits (LIHTC) for development
of affordable housing

Use TIF for a combination of affordable and market rate
housing as well as commercial uses.

13

Require the development of affordable housing for the use of TIF.

Explore establishing a Land Bank for property acquisition.
Use a layered approach to financing developments including
federal HOME funds, Federal Home Loan Bank AHP
(Affordable Housing Program) funds, trust funds, CDBG,
NIFA (Workforce Housing), and charitable sources.

Pursue private investors to use Opportunity Zone tax credits.
Use parking funds for a parking garage.

Acquire parking lots for PUDs (Planned Unit Developments)
that include mixed-use redevelopment with affordable and

market rate housing and commercial community needs such as
groceries, daycare, social services, etc.

$ Bankers' Bank
of the|West

[Method: Cyclesigmary g
0l &'(‘i:rlaﬂHO\_rse“, s

Recruit necessary community needs like a grocery store
and health clinic.

The Subcommittee also discussed increasing density in the existing
neighborhood and put forth the following recommendations:

Recommendations:

Use PUDs to adjust setbacks to allow construction of affordable
housing on non-buildable lots, allow mixed uses, and relax
parking requirements.

Remove barriers for co-op housing models

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



e Establish a Community Land Trust to purchase vacant
properties and lots.

iii. Code enforcement

The topic of enforcement is of special concern to the South of Downtown
focus area, as the area contains the highest percentage of rental units in the
city and is the oldest, most historic housing stock in Lincoln. Substandard
conditions are exacerbated by the area’s concentration of slip-in apartment
buildings, constructed in the 1960s and 1970s. Many of these apartment
buildings contribute to the high density of rental units in the area, which are
affordable but are substandard to dangerously unhealthy in health and
safety qualities. The committee looked to expanding Lincoln’s code
enforcement through a variety of options and strategies that addressed
both tenant and landlord responsibilities, as well as the city’s obligation to
enforce current codes for healthy living.

Current codes

The City of Lincoln has an inspection program in the Building and Safety
department. Currently, all rental buildings containing three or more units
are required to be registered with the City of Lincoln and are subject to
annual inspection of the exterior and common areas inside the building
(hallways, etc.). Furthermore, rental properties are subject to both exterior
and interior inspections when the property is sold or changes hands. Tenants
have the ability to report a code violation in their building through the
Building and Safety department. Tenants can report violations by calling
(402) 441-7521 or through the City’s UPLNK mobile phone app. The City of
Lincoln currently has a complaint-based system in which the interior of units

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help X @RConvert v [ Select
i @ Nebraska Legislature B GIS Viewer °y’ Request Search 8 Word 508 Acessibility Che... »~ lincoln.ne.gov Mayor Gr... Y2~ B -~ = @ ~ Pagev Safetyv Toosv @~ [0 {3 O
CITY OF
N E'ME ] O O DO &« B MG
NEBRASKA Codes eReader  Search Tables  Archives Links  Documents GISMap  UseGroup About

Search

@_] Title 10 VEHICLES AND TRAFFIC
el = .. 4 ) LINCOLN MUNICIPAL CODE
] Title 12 PARKS HOUSIN

Title 13 RESERVED
®_) Title 14 PUBLIC PROPERTY AND PUBLIC WAYS
#_) Title 15 RAILROADS

Chapter 21.05 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE OF THE CITY OF LINCOLN

= Contents:
%2 Title 16 UTILITY SERVICES i _ ) , )
=@ The 47 WATER 21.05.010 Adoption of Property Code 2012 Edition.
%) Tile 18 CONSTRUCTION OUTSIDE CITY 21.05.020 Section 101.1 Amended; Title.
%21 Title 19 FIRE PREVENTION 21.05.030 Section 101.2 Amended; Scope.
%] Title 20 BUILDING CODE 21.05.040 Section 101.3 Amended; Intent.
= 21.05.050 Section 102.3 Amended; Application of Other Codes.
(B 21.05.010 Adoption of Intemational Property Maintenance Code 2012 Edition ZLI 080 Sechioa J0L7 Codas sad
21.05.020 Section 101.1 Amended: Title 21.05.070 Section 103 Amended; Department of Building and Safety.
21.05.030 Section 101.2 Amended: Scope 21.05.080 Section 104.2 Amended; Inspections.
21.05.040 Section 101.3 Amended; Intent 21.05.090 Section 104.6 Amended; Department Records.

21,05 050 Section 102.3 Amended: Application of Other Codes o o e A
) 21.05 060 Section 102.7 Amended; Referenced Codes and Standards !

& 21.05.070 Section 103 Amended: Department of Building and Safety 21.05110 Section 105.8.1 Amanded; Test Mathads.

@ 21.05.080 Section 104 2 Amended; Inspections 21.05.120 Section 106 Amended; Violations.

() 21.05.090 Section 1046 Amended: Department Records 21.05.130 Section 107.1 Amended; Notice to Person Responsible.

21.05.100 Section 105.1 Amended; Modifications. 21.05.140 Section 107.3 Amended; Method of Service.

4091 10 Seckon 103 £ Amandad; ) eat Meltiodk: 21.05.150 Section 107.4 Amended; Unauthorized Tampering.
) Section jons. g o
1.05.130 Section 107.1 Amended; Notice to Person Responsible JECHING Dolon N 1 pas and Genaral.
1.05.140 Section 107.3 Amended: Methord of Servce. 21.05.170 Section 108.4.1 Amended; Placard Removal.
21.05.150 Section 107.4 Amended; Unauthorized Tampering 21.05.180 Section 108.5 Amended; Prohibited Occupancy.
21.05.160 Section 108.1 Amended; Unsafe Structures and Equipment; General 21.05.190 Section 103 Amended; Emergency Measures.

e e e nEe 21.05.200 Section 110 Amended; Demolition.

21.05.180 Section 108.5 Amended; Prohibited Occupancy. 2108210 Saction 117 Amandad: M A )

21.05.190 Section 109 Amended; Emergency Measures. L0 Saction manced; neans of Sppest.

21.05.200 Section 110 Amended: Demolition 21.05.225 International Property Maintenance Code Task Force Created.

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



15
are not proactively inspected, but instead relies on complaints to be made

for code enforcement. While tenants do not necessarily have to make
complaints themselves, the city requires a specific home/apartment address
to be supplied in order to know which unit has to be inspected.

The committee discussed at length adding more capacity and triggers for
inspection to the City’s current processes. Adding more reasons for
inspections of individual units and entire buildings would be done with the
intention of targeting landlords and property owners who are not fulfilling
their responsibilities. This would need to be done in conjunction with more
capacity for Building and Safety to carry out inspections and enforce
standards of housing.

Barriers to reporting code violations

The current complaint-driven system is a barrier for tenants in many
different aspects. One such aspect is the lack of tenant knowledge on what is
acceptable and what is a code violation. While currently landlords are
obligated to give their tenants a
copy of “A Gwdc.a to I'_arl’dlord & A GUIDE TO
Tenant Responsibilities”, prepared

by the City’s Building & Safety I.ANDI.ORD & TENANT
Department, Housing Code Office, RESPONS'B'L'T'ES

some tenants and landlords are
unaware of this obligation.
Furthermore, the Guide is only
available in English, making it
inaccessible to non-English
speakers. Likewise, the City’s staff
who take complaints via phone do
not have language resources to
interpret the tenant’s complaint if
they choose to call in, leaving the
tenant to be responsible for an
interpreter if they wish to file a
complaint.

Making sure that tenants know
their rights as well as their
responsibilities was a popular topic
of discussion. Many property
owners and managers on the
committee expressed a desire to

be made aware of issues within BUILDING & SAFETY DEPARTMENT
units, but acknowledged that HOUSING CODE OFFICE

555 South 10th Street
tenants do not always know how to Room 203

Lincoln, NE 68508

approach them with problems. 401/ 8417785

Reaching into diverse populations

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



16
was also a component of increasing tenant education, as the committee

acknowledged that reaching out to trusted spaces for different communities
would be key to spreading tenants’ rights knowledge to all residents of South
of Downtown and the City of Lincoln. Such places include cultural centers,
Community Learning Centers, and other community hubs and service
providers.

Another barrier to code enforcement is the identification of the tenant in
making a complaint. Because the City does not allow for a complaint to be
filed for an entire building but instead asks that specific units be identified,
this identifies the individuals living in the unit making the complaint. The
landlord can then identify who made the complaint. Many tenants also do
not know their rights in terms of anti-discrimination and anti-retaliation
protections that the city and state already have in place. While such
protections do exist for tenants, many are not aware or are not sure of the
extent of those protections.

Making other tenants aware of code violations in their building was explored
as a way to create a safer and more comfortable environment for tenants to
report code violations. In community conversations, tenants had expressed
not wanting to be singled out by their landlord, so the committee discussed
making all other tenants aware and encouraged to report violations in their
own unit, possibly prompting an entire building inspection if the complaints
are deemed valid. Upon receiving a valid complaint, Building and Safety
should leave a card at the door of other residents within the building to alert
them that there was an issue in one of the apartments and that here is how
to go on line or phone if there are issues within another apartment.

While not all property owners or landlords are actively neglecting their
properties, many properties in the South of Downtown area do not receive
proper attention and maintenance. Some property owners are not
responsive or attentive to the condition of their properties because they do
not live in the area or may not even live in the city or state. This contributes
to the lack of attention or concern for the property or tenants’ living
conditions. Property managers are required to have such a license to
manage properties they do not own. Continuing education is required of
broker managers including passing an ethics course, with renewal of fair
housing and ethics every two years. The committee discussed incorporating
some landlord education on anti-discrimination and anti-retaliation
emphases in these continuing education requirements. Landlord education
was acknowledged as important for the committee because it would also
benefit the property owner to maintain their investment.

Also discussed was a proactive inspection program to be adopted within
Building and Safety’s current inspection process. A proactive inspection
model exists in South Sioux City, Nebraska, where properties are inspected
on both interior and exterior on a regular basis. Currently, two valid
complaints of the interior of two separate units are required to trigger a full

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



building inspection. The proactive inspection model would take the onus off
the tenant to report, and remove the need to put themselvesin a
vulnerable position with their landlord, and would instead be an
expectation of all rental properties. However, implementing this strategy
would require more capacity for Building and Safety for administration,
inspectors, and enforcement of building codes.

Lastly, the South of Downtown area boasts a largely diverse population, with
high concentrations of New Americans and refugees due to the affordability
of the units in the area. Given that the City’s processes and materials for
code enforcement are not translated into different languages, large
demographics are not even able to access the information necessary to
maintain a safe, healthy place to live. However, the City is limited in funding
for services such as interpretation, translation, and even building inspectors
to enforce codes in a timely and appropriate manner. Funding for additional
support to address these barriers should be explored in future budget
conversations.

Recommendations:

e Add content on adequacy of property management to
Landlord Education/Real Estate Licensees and Broker
Licensing education requirements.

Expand code enforcement services.

Create a Proactive Inspection Program.

Increase Tenant Education.

Code Violation Notices to Tenants.
Preservation of existing affordable housing

The committee looked at the wealth of existing affordable housing units
already in the neighborhood. Many of these apartments were built 50 to 90
years ago. Many of the rents in these buildings are affordable for
households in the 30 - 80% of Area Median Income range the Subcommittee
identified to address.

With the properties that were older and affordable but did not pose chronic
code violations, the committee looked at strategies that would help preserve
these housing units for the next 50 years.

One presentation to the committee suggested a PUD overlay would allow a
more flexible zoning standard. The committee was shown pictures of Austin,
Texas (Rainey Street) where older residential buildings on the edge of
downtown had been converted into commercial spaces. This conversion
allowed the properties to afford renovations to the remaining residential
spaces. In some cases, kitchens and outdoor dining were used and the
neighborhood’s density and walkability made these very successful
operations.

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19

17



In a series of charrettes starting on March
12 the large Subcommittee broke into three
sub groups. The small groups were tasked
with addressing a number of issues,
including the issue of zoning changes that
would change residential spaces into
commercial uses. Two of the three sub-
groups rejected this plan principally because
it ran counter to the committees charge of
preserving or adding affordable housing.

Members of the executive committee
attended a meeting with City Law and
Building and Safety Departments to review
the possible adoption of what was said to be
a more flexible building code. Building and
Safety is reviewing an adoption of a
remodeling building code. The discussion in
the larger Subcommittee about changes to
the building codes allowing renovation of
older buildings that did not directly impact
health and safety issues generally were
accepted as a positive step towards
encouraging investment that would
preserve older apartments.

In February, both the large group and the
executive committee discussed the LES
sustainable energy program that was
designed to bend demand, which causes LES
to add additional generating capacity. LES, in their budget, had not found
applicants for a million dollars of sustainable energy funds. The group and
LES discussed possible modifications of this program to make better use of
these funds for their intended purpose and at the same time allow the funds
to help preserve this large stock of affordable housing within the city. LES
agreed to do an energy audit of several of the buildings within the Everett
Neighborhood and report back their findings. The Subcommittee felt that
alterations of some of the criteria that would allow expanded funding in a
targeted manner would allow LES a means to determine if they could get a
greater bang for their buck. The mission of preserving existing affordable
housing would also be more successful.

Recommendations:

e Adopt the International Property Maintenance Code (building
codes specific to rehabilitation) to increase investment in older
properties.

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



19
e Create incentive programs for rehabilitation tied to preservation

of affordable housing.
e Modify the LES sustainable energy fund.
e Expand the use of co-op housing to preserve existing buildings.

e Expanded use of the “small TIF” program with preferences
for affordable housing.

e Restrict on street parking during certain hours to residents of
the neighborhood.

e Address parking regulations and requirements that
prevent affordable housing.

c. Prioritization

At the May 215 meeting, the Subcommittee approved all the strategies listed in
this report. Subcommittee members had the opportunity (at the May 21t
meeting) to nominate and approve additional strategies. Also at the May 21
meeting, a dot exercise was completed to help prioritize those previously
approved strategies. Each member was given six dots and was instructed to
place three dots on strategies that increase the supply of affordable housing and
three on those that help preserve and protect existing affordable housing. An
on-line follow up for those strategies added on May 215 was done and has been
included in the Summary Report.

3. Conclusions

The Subcommittee discussed the next steps to implement the strategies identified in this report.
It was recommended that “Champions” be identified to implement each of the strategies.
“Champions” are individuals, groups or government departments that will spearhead each or
several of the strategies. The Subcommittee identified this as a task for the South of Downtown
Coalition Steering Committee and would also fall under the purview of the consultant chosen to
implement the Lincoln Affordable Housing Coordinated Action Plan.

All the Subcommittee members felt that the success of the South of Downtown Affordable

Housing Subcommittee recommendations require a rapid implementation of multiple
strategies.

South of Downtown Affordable Housing Subcommittee 6-11-19



